[image: ]

Editorial Changes—Report No. 20
1 July 2025–31 December 2025
In preparing compilations for registration during the above period, First Parliamentary Counsel made the following editorial changes under the Legislation Act 2003.
The summary of editorial changes for the 21 compilations affected is as follows:

	Item
	Kind of editorial change
	Number

	1
	Changes to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives
	1

	2
	Changes to punctuation
	3

	3
	Changes to typeface
	1

	4
	Correct typographical errors
	1

	5
	Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
	21

	6
	Numbering or renumbering of provisions
	1

	7
	Removal of redundant text
	9

	8
	Reordering of provisions
	1

	9
	Updates to cross‑references
	1


Please note that each instance of the power being used in a compilation is counted. This means that for a number of compilations the power has been used multiple times (for example, to correct typographical errors in different sections of the same compilation).
Complete details of each use of the power within a compilation appears below:
[bookmark: _Hlk191020959][bookmark: _Hlk65573904][bookmark: _Hlk142572994][bookmark: _Hlk112413228][bookmark: _Hlk77771523][bookmark: _Hlk117851081][bookmark: _Hlk115097349][bookmark: _Hlk115164529][bookmark: _Hlk87971872][bookmark: _Hlk111628764][bookmark: _Hlk109895787][bookmark: _Hlk100752153][bookmark: _Hlk98834175][bookmark: _Hlk95228066][bookmark: _Hlk88214706][bookmark: _Hlk88059733][bookmark: _Hlk87973336][bookmark: _Hlk86239383][bookmark: _Hlk85202742][bookmark: _Hlk83806415][bookmark: _Hlk78211436][bookmark: _Hlk78982182][bookmark: _Toc159817352][bookmark: _Toc151439511][bookmark: _Toc151265172][bookmark: _Toc101876442][bookmark: _Toc101844710][bookmark: _Toc101772215][bookmark: _Toc101684071][bookmark: _Toc101683873][bookmark: _Toc101683529][bookmark: _Toc101349090][bookmark: _Toc206912603][bookmark: _Toc206912689][bookmark: CITATION]Australia New Zealand Food Standards Code – Schedule 3 – Identity and purity, Compilation No. 30, Registration Date: 15 August 2025 [F2025C00802]
Subsection S3—2(2) and section S3—54(A)
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions and update to a cross-reference
Details of editorial change
Item [2] of the Schedule to the Food Standards (Application A1308 – 2′-FL from GM Escherichia coli W in infant formula products) Variation instructs to insert section S3—54 after section S3—53. However, there is already a section S3—54.
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the first occurring section S3—54 as section S3—54(A) and updating the provision cross-reference for 2′-fucosyllactose sourced from Escherichia coli W in subsection S3—2(2) to “section S3—54(A)”.
National Health (Immunisation Program — Designated Vaccines) Determination 2014 (No.1), Compilation No. 28, Registration Date: 29 July 2025 [F2025C00753]
Subsection 7(1C)
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the National Health (Immunisation Program — Designated Vaccines) Amendment Determination 2025 instructs to insert subsection 7(1C) after subsection 7(1).
This amendment results in the subsections appearing in the following order: (1A), (1B), (1), (1C), (2), (3).
This compilation was editorially changed to move subsection 7(1C) to after subsection 7(1B) to correct the alphanumerical order.
Health Insurance (Pathologist‑determinable Services) Determination 2015, Compilation No. 11, Registration Date: 28 July 2025 [F2025C00744]
Subparagraph 5(b)(iii) (table item 1, column 1)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 1 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2025 Measures No.2) Determination 2025 instructs to insert “73319” after “, 72852” in column 1 of table item 1 of subparagraph 5(b)(iii).
This compilation was editorially changed to insert a comma before “73319” in column 1 of table item 1 of subparagraph 5(b)(iii) to correct the punctuation.
Subparagraph 5(b)(iii) (Note under table)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 2 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2025 Measures No.2) Determination 2025 instructs to insert “73319” after “, 72860” in the note under the table in subparagraph 5(b)(iii).
The text “, 72860” does not appear in the note under the table in subparagraph 5(b)(iii). However, the text “72860” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “, 73319” after “72860” in the note under the table in subparagraph 5(b)(iii) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to correct the punctuation.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth Attendances) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 25, Registration Date: 28 July 2025 [F2025C00747]
Schedule 2
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Amendment (Specialist Items and Other Changes) Determination 2025 provides, in part, as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk204328268]1  Schedule 2 (after item 92701)
Insert:
	Subgroup A44 - Specialist and Consultant Physician - Telehealth Services
	

	Column 1
Item
	Column 2 
Description
	Column 3
Fee ($)

	92748
	Video attendance for a person by a consultant occupational physician in the practice of the consultant occupational physician's specialty of occupational medicine if:
(a)	the attendance follows referral of the patient to the consultant occupational physician 
(b)	the attendance is of more than 5 minutes in duration; 
(c)	the attendance is an initial attendance in a single course of treatment; and
(d)	the attendance on the patient, being an attendance to which item 385, 91822, or 104 applies did not take place on the same day by the same consultant occupational physician.

	98.95

	[...]
	
	


This amendment results in two occurrences of the table column headings in the table.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the second occurrence of the table column headings from Schedule 2 to remove the redundant text.
Schedule 3 (items 93033 and 93036, column 2)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 items 14 and 15 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Allied Health Services) Amendment (Eligible Providers) Determination 2025 provide as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk204325196]14  Schedule 3 (item 93033, column 2)
Omit “Speech pathology, occupational therapy, audiology, optometry, orthoptic or physiotherapy health service provided by telehealth attendance to a patient aged under 25 years by an eligible speech pathologist, occupational therapist, audiologist, optometrist, orthoptist or physiotherapist if:”, substitute “Audiology, dietetic, exercise physiology, occupational therapy, optometry, orthoptic, physiotherapy or speech pathology health service provided by telehealth attendance to a patient aged under 25 years by an eligible audiologist, dietitian, exercise physiologist, occupational therapist, optometrist, orthoptist, physiotherapist or speech pathologist if:”
15  Schedule 3 (item 93036, column 2)
Omit “Speech pathology, occupational therapy, audiology, optometry, orthoptic or physiotherapy health service provided by telehealth attendance to a patient aged under 25 years for the treatment of a diagnosed complex neurodevelopmental disorder (such as autism spectrum disorder) or eligible disability by an eligible speech pathologist, occupational therapist, audiologist, optometrist, orthoptist or physiotherapist, if:”, substitute: “Audiology, dietetic, exercise physiology, occupational therapy, optometry, orthoptic, physiotherapy or speech pathology health service provided by telehealth attendance to a patient aged under 25 years for the treatment of a diagnosed complex neurodevelopmental disorder (such as autism spectrum disorder) or eligible disability by an eligible audiologist, dietitian, exercise physiologist, occupational therapist, optometrist, orthoptist, physiotherapist or speech pathologist, if:”.
The text “telehealth attendance” does not appear in column 2 of items 93033 and 93036 of Schedule 3. However, the text “video attendance” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to apply the amendments to column 2 of items 93033 and 93036 of Schedule 3 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Schedule 3 (items 93092 and 93126, column 2)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 items 8 and 9 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Amendment (Specialist Items and Other Changes) Determination 2025 provide as follows:
8	Schedule 2 (item 93092, column 2)
Omit “person”.
9	Schedule 2 (item 93126, column 2)
Omit “person”.
Items 93092 and 93126 do not appear in Schedule 2. However, items 93092 and 93126 do appear in Schedule 3.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “person” from column 2 of items 93092 and 93126 of Schedule 3 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
List of Exempt Native Specimens Instrument 2001, Compilation No. 454, Registration Date: 28 July 2025 [F2025C00746]
Schedule 1, entry for South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the List of Exempt Native Specimens Amendment (South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery) Instrument, July 2025 provides as follows:
1	Under the heading Freshwater and Marine Animals
Omit the following rows in the table:

	Taxon/Item
	Common Name
	Notation

	Specimens that are or are derived from fish or invertebrates, other than specimens that belong to species listed under Part 13 of the EPBC Act, taken in the South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery
	South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery
	The specimen, or the fish or invertebrate from which it is derived, was taken lawfully;
The specimens are included in the list until 25 July 2025.



The text contained in the Taxon/Item column of the Schedule 1 entry for the South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 1 of the List of Exempt Native Specimens Amendment (South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery) Instrument, July 2025.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the Schedule 1 entry for the South Australian Rock Lobster Fishery and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Determination 2014, Compilation No. 53, Registration Date: 21 July 2025 [F2025C00720]
Section 64ZT
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 item 1 of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (March Residential Care Subsidy Increase) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “13.46” and substitute “$15.60” in section 64ZT.
This amendment results in two dollar signs before “15.60”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the first occurring dollar sign before “15.60” in section 64ZT to remove the redundant text.
Section 91
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 13) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation) Instrument 2025 instructs to omit “$1.36 for DVEA” and substitute “$1.39” in section 91.
The text “$1.36 for DVEA” does not appear in section 91. However, the text “$1.36” does appear in the definition of DVEA in section 91.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$1.36” and substitute “$1.39” in the definition of DVEA in section 91 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Section 91
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 14) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation) Instrument 2025 instructs to omit “$47.12 for HMA” and substitute “$48.16” in section 91.
The text “$47.12 for HMA” does not appear in section 91. However, the text “$47.12” does appear in the definition of HMA in section 91.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$47.12” and substitute “$48.16” in the definition of HMA in section 91 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Section 92
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 15) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation) Instrument 2025 instructs to omit “$148.43 for B” and substitute “$151.70” in section 92.
The text “$148.43 for B” does not appear in section 92. However, the text “$148.43” does appear in the definition of B in section 92.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$148.43” and substitute “$151.70” in the definition of B in section 92 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Subsection 93(1) (table to the “Direct care minutes supplement amount”)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation) Instrument 2025 instructs to repeal and substitute the table to the “direct care minutes amount” in subsection 93(1).
“direct care minutes amount” does not appear in subsection 93(1). However, “Direct care minutes supplement amount” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the table to the “Direct care minutes supplement amount” in subsection 93(1) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – National Lung Cancer Screening Program) Determination 2025, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 21 July 2025 [F2025C00728]
Section 1 of Schedule 1 (table subheading)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2025 Measures No. 3) Determination 2025 provides as follows:
1  Section 1 (table subheading)
After “Subgroup 14” insert “—Low dose computed tomography”.
The heading to item 1 refers to “Section 1” rather than “Section 1 of Schedule 1”.
This compilation was editorially changed to apply the amendment to the table subheading in section 1 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Cardiac MRI for Myocarditis) Determination 2024, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 18 July 2025 [F2025C00713]
Schedule 1 (item 63390, column 3)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 6 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$602.15” and substitute “$616.60” in column 3 of item 63390 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$602.15” does not appear in column 3 of item 63390 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “602.15” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column 3 heading already includes the dollar sign for the fee.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “602.15” and substitute “616.60” in column 3 of item 63390 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Private Health Insurance (Benefit Requirements) Rules 2011, Compilation No. 101, Registration Date: 18 July 2025 [F2025C00718]
Subclause 4(1) of Schedule 3 (table dealing with “Type B day procedures: Band 1 – list of MBS item”)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 5 of the Private Health Insurance Legislation Amendment Rules (No. 5) 2025 instructs to repeal and substitute the table dealing with “Type B procedure - Band 1 – list of MBS items” in subclause 4(1) of Schedule 3.
“Type B procedure - Band 1 – list of MBS items” does not appear in subclause 4(1) of Schedule 3. However, “Type B day procedures: Band 1 – list of MBS item” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the table dealing with “Type B day procedures: Band 1 – list of MBS item” in subclause 4(1) of Schedule 3 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Co‑Dependent Pathology Services) Determination 2018, Compilation No. 24, Registration Date: 16 July 2025 [F2025C00704]
Schedule 1 (item 72814, Fee ($))
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 3 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$74.50” and substitute “$76.30” in the column headed “fee ($)” of item 72814 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$74.50” does not appear in the column headed “Fee ($)” of item 72814 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “74.50” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column headed “Fee ($)” already includes the dollar sign for the fee in the heading.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “74.50” and substitute “76.30” in the column headed “Fee ($)” of item 72814 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging – Conjunctive Thallium‑201 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2023, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 16 July 2025 [F2025C00703]
Schedule 1 (item 61470, column 3)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 4 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$1,515.05” and substitute “$1,551.40” in column 3 of item 61470 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$1,515.05” does not appear in column 3 of item 61470 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “1,515.05” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column 3 heading already includes the dollar sign for the fee.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “1,515.05” and substitute “1,551.40” in column 3 of item 61470 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Conjunctive Gallium‑67 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2022, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 16 July 2025 [F2025C00702]
Schedule 1 (item 61477, column 3)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 5 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$995.65” and substitute “$1,019.55” in column 3 of item 61477 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$995.65” does not appear in column 3 of item 61477 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “995.65” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column 3 heading already includes the dollar sign for the fee.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “995.65” and substitute “1,019.55” in column 3 of item 61477 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Whole Body Magnetic Resonance Imaging Scan) Determination 2022, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 15 July 2025 [F2025C00687]
Schedule (item 63564, column 3)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 1 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$1,616.40” and substitute “$1,655.20” in column 3 of item 63564 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$1,616.40” does not appear in column 3 of item 63564 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “1,616.40” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column 3 heading already includes the dollar sign for the fee.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “1,616.40” and substitute “1,655.20” in column 3 of item 63564 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services — Artificial Bowel Sphincter Services) Determination 2023, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 15 July 2025 [F2025C00686]
Schedule 1 (item 32221, column 3)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 2 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “$1,029.75” and substitute “$1,054.45” in column 3 of item 32221 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$1,029.75” does not appear in column 3 of item 32221 of Schedule 1. However, the fee of “1,029.75” does appear.
This amendment results in a redundant dollar sign, as the column 3 heading already includes the dollar sign for the fee.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “1,029.75” and substitute “1,054.45” in column 3 of item 32221 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended and to remove the redundant text.
Aged Care (Transitional Provisions) (Subsidy and Other Measures) Determination 2014, Compilation No. 50, Registration Date: 11 July 2025 [F2025C00668]
Section 91R
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 item 2 of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (March Residential Care Subsidy Increase) Determination 2025 instructs to omit “13.46” and substitute “$15.60” in section 91R.
This amendment results in two dollar signs before “15.60”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the first occurring dollar sign before “15.60” in section 91R to remove the redundant text.
Health Insurance (General Medical Services Table) Regulations 2021, Compilation No. 19, Registration Date: 11 July 2025 [F2025C00640]
[bookmark: _Hlk202879951]Clause 7.1.1 of Schedule 1 (paragraph (a) of the definition of associated medical practitioner)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation and change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 40 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2025 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2025 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk202944591]40  Clause 7.1.1 of Schedule 1 (paragraph (a) of the definition of associated medical practitioner)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute:
	(a)	for items 393 and 967—has the meaning given by clause 2.16.2.
Paragraph (a) ends in a full stop despite being followed by paragraph (b).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the full stop at the end of paragraph (a) of the definition of associated medical practitioner in clause 7.1.1 of Schedule 1 and substitute “; and” to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
National Health (Highly Specialised Drugs Program) Special Arrangement 2021 (PB 27 of 2021), Compilation No. 52, Registration Date: 9 July 2025 [F2025C00662]
Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 6 of National Health (Highly Specialised Drugs Program) Special Arrangement Amendment (July Update) Instrument 2025 (PB 77 of 2025) provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk202534005][6]	Schedule 1, after entry for Etanercept in the form Injection 50 mg in 1 mL single use-auto injector, 4 [Brand: Enbrel]
insert:
	
	
	
	Nepexto
	C9417 C14068 C14070 C14071 C14154 C14155
	
	See Schedule 2
	See Schedule 2


The text “Injection 50 mg in 1 mL single use-auto injector, 4” does not appear in the entry for Etanercept in Schedule 1. However, the text “Injection 50 mg in 1 mL single use auto-injector, 4” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the new table row in Schedule 1 after the entry for Etanercept in the form Injection 50 mg in 1 mL single use auto‑injector, 4 [Brand: Enbrel] to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Competition and Consumer Regulations 2010, Compilation No. 95, Registration Date: 7 July 2025 [F2025C00645]
Form JBA of Part 4 of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Change to typeface
Details of editorial change
Form JBA of Part 4 of Schedule 1 refers to “(Full Name)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to italicise the letter “e” in “(Full Name)” in Form JBA of Part 4 of Schedule 1 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Migration Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 277, Registration Date: 7 July 2025 [F2025C00644]
Subregulation 5.19(5A)
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Subregulation 5.19(5A) refers to “Temporary Resident Transition stream” rather than “Temporary Residence Transition stream”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Temporary Resident Transition stream” and substitute “Temporary Residence Transition stream” in subregulation 5.19(5A) to correct the typographical error.
Renewable Energy (Electricity) Regulations 2001, Compilation No. 88, Registration Date: 7 July 2025 [F2025C00638]
Subregulation 20AH(1) (note)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 42 of the Renewable Energy (Electricity) Amendment (Cheaper Home Batteries Program) Regulations 2025 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk202540274]42  At the end of subregulation 20AH(1)
[bookmark: _Hlk202448257]Note:	For paragraph (a), the 3 or more statements may include any combination of statements made under subregulation 20AC(5A) or 20ACA(13).
The instruction to add the note is missing.
This compilation was editorially changed to add the note at the end of subregulation 20AH(1) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Competition and Consumer Act 2010, Compilation No. 159, Registration Date: 1 July 2025 [C2025C00366]
Chapter 1 (heading)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 2 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Mergers and Acquisitions Reform) Act 2024 provides as follows:
2  Before Part 1
Insert:
Chapter 1—Preliminary
Part 1 does not appear. However, Part I does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the Chapter 1 heading before Part I to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Paragraph 104(a)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 54 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Mergers and Acquisitions Reform) Act 2024 instructs to insert “or by the Commission” after “before the Tribunal” in paragraph 104(a).
The text “before the Tribunal” appears twice in paragraph 104(a).
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “or by the Commission” after “before the Tribunal” (second occurring) in paragraph 104(a) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Paragraph 51(1C)(b) of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 78 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Mergers and Acquisitions Reform) Act 2024 provides as follows:
78  Paragraph 51(1C)(b) of Schedule 1
Before “section 50 or 50A”, insert “Division 1A or”.
The text “section 50 or 50A” does not appear in paragraph 51(1C)(b) of Schedule 1. However, the text “section 50” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “Division 1A or” before “section 50” in paragraph 51(1C)(b) of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________
28 Sydney Avenue  Forrest  ACT  2603
Locked Bag 30 Kingston ACT 2604 • Telephone (02) 6120 1400 • Fax (02) 6120 1403 • ABN 41 425 630 817
www.opc.gov.au
S25gm136.v03.docx
[S25gm136.v03.docx] [17-Aug-25] [4:09 PM]		Page  2
image1.jpeg
Australian Government

Office of Parliamentary Counsel





