[image: ]

[bookmark: _GoBack]Editorial Changes—Report No. 16
1 July 2023–31 December 2023
In preparing compilations for registration during the above period, First Parliamentary Counsel made the following editorial changes under the Legislation Act 2003.
The summary of editorial changes for the 80 compilations affected is as follows:

	Item
	Kind of editorial change
	Number

	1
	Changes to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives
	1

	2
	Changes to punctuation
	13

	3
	Changes to spelling
	3

	4
	Correct an error arising out of an amendment of an instrument
	2

	5
	Correct typographical errors
	7

	6
	Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
	51

	7
	Numbering or renumbering of provisions
	11

	8
	Removal of redundant text
	12

	9
	Reordering of definitions
	7

	10
	Updates to cross‑references
	1

	11
	Updates to references of a law or a provision
	11



Please note that each instance of the power being used in a compilation is counted. This means that for a number of compilations the power has been used multiple times (for example, to correct typographical errors in different sections of the same compilation).
Complete details of each use of the power within a compilation appears below:
[bookmark: _Hlk142572994][bookmark: _Hlk112413228][bookmark: _Hlk77771523][bookmark: _Hlk117851081][bookmark: _Hlk115097349][bookmark: _Hlk115164529][bookmark: _Hlk87971872][bookmark: _Hlk111628764][bookmark: _Hlk109895787][bookmark: _Hlk100752153][bookmark: _Hlk98834175][bookmark: _Hlk95228066][bookmark: _Hlk88214706][bookmark: _Hlk88059733][bookmark: _Hlk87973336][bookmark: _Hlk86239383][bookmark: _Hlk85202742][bookmark: _Hlk83806415][bookmark: _Hlk78211436][bookmark: _Hlk78982182][bookmark: _Toc159817352][bookmark: _Toc151439511][bookmark: _Toc151265172][bookmark: _Toc101876442][bookmark: _Toc101844710][bookmark: _Toc101772215][bookmark: _Toc101684071][bookmark: _Toc101683873][bookmark: _Toc101683529][bookmark: _Toc101349090][bookmark: _Toc206912603][bookmark: _Toc206912689][bookmark: CITATION]Autonomous Sanctions (Designated Persons and Entities and Declared Persons – Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) List 2012, Compilation No. 18, Registration Date: 20 December 2023 [F2023C01163]
Section 7 (second occurring)
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 Part 1 item 1 of the Autonomous Sanctions (Designated Persons and Entities and Declared Persons—Democratic People’s Republic of Korea) Amendment (No. 3) Instrument 2023 instructs to insert section 7 at the end of Part 3. However, a section 7 already appears.
This compilation was editorially changed to renumber the second occurring section 7 as section 8.
National Health (Minimum Stockholding) Determination 2023 (PB 65 of 2023), Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 19 December 2023 [F2023C01152]
Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 items 2, 3, 5, 16, 19, 24, 33, 40, 42, 47, 51, 52, 57, 81, 83, 85, 91, 96, 100 and 101 of the National Health (Minimum Stockholding) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2023 (PB 125 of 2023) instruct to omit various entries from Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Column 5 Applicable quantity” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 items 2, 3, 5, 16, 19, 24, 33, 40, 42, 47, 51, 52, 57, 81, 83, 85, 91, 96, 100 and 101 of the National Health (Minimum Stockholding) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2023 (PB 125 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the entries from Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 13, Registration Date: 14 December 2023 [F2023C01134]
Schedule 1 (Group A40 table)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 items 17 to 26 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Amendment (General Practice) Determination 2023 instruct to repeal and substitute the cell in column 2 of table items 92024, 92025, 92026, 92027, 92028, 92055, 92056, 92057, 92058 and 92059 of Schedule 1.
These table items appear twice in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the cell in column 2 of table items 92024, 92025, 92026, 92027, 92028, 92055, 92056, 92057, 92058 and 92059 in the Group A40 table of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Crimes Act 1914, Compilation No. 150, Registration Date: 11 December 2023 [C2023C00463]
Paragraph 3UJB(2)(g)
Kind of editorial change
Change to grammar, syntax or the use of conjunctives or disjunctives
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 13 of the Counter‑Terrorism and Other Legislation Amendment Act 2023 instructs to insert paragraphs (e), (f) and (g) at the end of subsection 3UJB(2).
The newly inserted paragraph 3UJB(2)(g) contains the phrase “in response applications made by AFP police officers”.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the word “to” after “in response” in paragraph 3UJB(2)(g) to correct the grammatical error.
Location Offset Rules 2018, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 11 December 2023 [F2023C01100]
Clause 2.9 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
[bookmark: _Hlk152581134]Schedule 1 item 6 of the Location Offset Amendment Rules 2023 instructs to insert “former” before “Division 10B of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936” in clause 2.9 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1.
The text “Division 10B of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936” does not appear in clause 2.9 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1. However, the text “Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “former” before “Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936” in clause 2.9 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Clause 2.10 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions and change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the Location Offset Amendment Rules 2023 provides as follows:
7  Clause 2.10 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1
[bookmark: _Hlk152595064]Repeal the clause, substitute “Whether a deduction has been claimed under former Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936 in relation to the film”.
The substituted clause does not contain the clause number “2.10” and is missing a full stop at the end of the clause.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the clause number “2.10” at the beginning of the clause and to insert a full stop at the end of the clause in Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Clause 2.11 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions and change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 13 of the Location Offset Amendment Rules 2023 provides as follows:
13  Clause 2.11 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2
Repeal the clause, substitute, “Whether a deduction has been claimed under former Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936 in relation to the film”.
The substituted clause does not contain the clause number “2.11” and is missing a full stop at the end of the clause.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the clause number “2.11” at the beginning of the clause and to insert a full stop at the end of the clause in Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Clause 1.5 of Part B of Schedule 2
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 18 of the Location Offset Amendment Rules 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk152583740]18  After clause 1.4 of Part B of Schedule 2
1.5	Any agreement relating to:
(a)	the establishment of the applicant company; or
(b)	the transfer of any film production responsibility from an outgoing company to the applicant; or
(c)	the distribution or exhibition of the completed film.
Examples for paragraph (c):
1	A deal memorandum.
2	A letter of confirmation, on official letterhead, from the distributor.
The instruction to insert the clause is missing.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert clause 1.5 after clause 1.4 of Part B of Schedule 2 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
PDV Offset Rules 2018, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 8 December 2023 [F2023C01089]
Clause 2.10 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions and change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the PDV Offset Amendment Rules 2023 provides as follows:
7  Clause 2.10 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1
Repeal the clause, substitute “Whether a deduction has been claimed under former Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936 in relation to the film”. 
The substituted clause does not contain the clause number “2.10” and is missing a full stop at the end of the clause.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the clause number “2.10” at the beginning of the clause and to insert a full stop at the end of the clause in Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 1 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Clause 2.11 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2
Kind of editorial change
Numbering or renumbering of provisions and change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 13 of the PDV Offset Amendment Rules 2023 provides as follows:
13  Clause 2.11 of Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2
[bookmark: _Hlk131662473]Repeal the clause, substitute, “Whether a deduction has been claimed under former Division 10BA of Part III of the Income Tax Assessment Act 1936 in relation to the film”.
The substituted clause does not contain the clause number “2.11” and is missing a full stop at the end of the clause.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert the clause number “2.11” at the beginning of the clause and to insert a full stop at the end of the clause in Division 2 of Part A of Schedule 2 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Airspace Regulations 2007, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 5 December 2023 [F2023C01070]
Regulation 7 (heading)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 10 of the Airspace Amendment (Danger Areas) Regulations 2023 provides as follows:
10  Regulation 7 (heading)
After “publication”, insert “etc.”.
The word “publication” does not appear in the heading to regulation 7. However, the word “Publication” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “etc.” after “Publication” in the heading to regulation 7 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Competition and Consumer Act 2010, Compilation No. 147, Registration Date: 1 December 2023 [C2023C00449]
Subsection 28A(3) of Schedule 2
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 item 3 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 provides as follows:
3  Subsection 28A(3)
Omit “Chapter 7 of”.
This item refers to “Subsection 28A(3)” rather than “Subsection 28A(3) of Schedule 2”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Chapter 7 of” from subsection 28A(3) of Schedule 2 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Private Health Insurance (National Joint Replacement Register Levy) Rule 2015, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 29 November 2023 [F2023C01060]
Subsection 7(4) (definition of NJRR funding amount)
Kind of editorial change
Correct an error arising out of an amendment of an instrument
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Private Health Insurance (National Joint Replacement Register Levy) Amendment (NJRR Funding Amount) Rule 2023 provides as follows:
1  Subsection 7(4) (definition of NJRR funding amount)
Repeal the definition, substitute:
(a)	for the levy day on 30 November 2023 — $2,674,312.74; or
(b)	for the levy day on 30 November of any financial year after 30 November 2023 — $2,674,312.74.
This amendment results in the text “NJRR funding amount means:” being repealed.
This compilation was editorially changed to reinsert the text “NJRR funding amount means:” before “(a) for the levy day on 30 November 2023 — $2,674,312.74; or” in subsection 7(4) to correct the error arising out of the amendment.
Woomera Prohibited Area Rule 2014 Determination of Exclusion Periods for Amber Zone 1 and Amber Zone 2 for Financial Year 2023‑2024, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 29 November 2023 [F2023C01061]
Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Correct an error arising out of an amendment of an instrument
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Woomera Prohibited Area Rule 2014 Determination of Exclusion Periods for Amber Zone 1 and Amber Zone 2 for Financial Year 2023‑2024 Amendment Determination No.1 provides as follows:
1  Schedule 1 – Exclusion Periods
Omit the following:

	Exclusion Period
	Zone to which the Exclusion Period applies

	13 November 2023 – 19 November 2023
	Amber Zone 2

	20 November 2023 – 26 November 2023
	Amber Zone 2

	27 November 2023 – 03 December 2023
	Amber Zone 2

	04 December 2023 – 10 December 2023
	Amber Zone 2

	11 December 2023 – 17 December 2023
	Amber Zone 2


This amendment results in the table column headings being omitted.
This compilation was editorially changed to reinsert the table column headings in Schedule 1 to correct the error arising out of the amendment.
Australian Securities and Investments Commission Act 2001, Compilation No. 96, Registration Date: 28 November 2023 [C2023C00443]
Sections 12GNE, 12GNF and 12GNG
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 40 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (More Competition, Better Prices) Act 2022 instructs to insert sections 12GNE, 12GNF and 12GNG after section 12GND of Schedule 2.
Section 12GND of Schedule 2 does not appear. However, section 12GND does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert sections 12GNE, 12GNF and 12GNG after section 12GND to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (General Medical Services Table) Regulations 2021, Compilation No. 14, Registration Date: 28 November 2023 [F2023C01056]
Subclause 1.2.5(1) of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Schedule 4 item 2 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2023 Measures No. 3) Regulations 2023 provides as follows:
2  Subclause 1.2.5(1) of Schedule 1
Repeal the subclause, substitute:
	(1)	Use this clause for items 3 to 338, 348 to 388, 410 to 417, 585 to 600, 733, 737, 741, 745, 761, 763, 766, 769, 772, 776, 788, 789, 792, 900, 903, 969, 971, 972, 973, 975, 986, 2497 to 2840, 3005 to 3028, 5000 to 5267, 6007 to 6015, 6018 to 6024, 6051 to 6063, 13899, 16401, 16404, 16406, 16407, 16508, 16509, 16533, 16534, 17610 to 17690, 90020 to 90096, 90098, 90183, 90188, 90202, 90212, 90215 and 90250 to 90278”.
A closing double quotation mark appears at the end of the substituted text. This compilation was editorially changed to omit the closing double quotation mark to correct the typographical error.
Clause 2.30.2 of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 4 item 59 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2023 Measures No. 3) Regulations 2023 instructs to insert table items 90098, 90183, 90188, 90202, 90212 and 90215 at the end of the Group A35 table in clause 2.30.1 of Schedule 1.
The Group A35 table does not appear in clause 2.30.1 of Schedule 1. However, the Group A35 table does appear in clause 2.30.2 of Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert table items 90098, 90183, 90188, 90202, 90212 and 90215 at the end of the Group A35 table in clause 2.30.2 of Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – General Practice Attendance for Assessing Patient Suitability for a COVID‑19 Vaccine) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 12, Registration Date: 28 November 2023 [F2023C01055]
Subsection 9(1)
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 9 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation No. 2) Determination 2023 instructs to omit “144.00” and substitute “$144.70” in subsection 9(1).
This amendment results in two dollar signs before “144.70”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the first occurring dollar sign before “144.70” in subsection 9(1) to remove the redundant text.
National Health (Immunisation Program – Designated Vaccines) Determination 2014 (No.1), Compilation No. 25, Registration Date: 28 November 2023 [F2023C01051]
Part 2 of Schedule 1 (table item 210A)
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 3 of the National Health (Immunisation Program—Designated Vaccines) Amendment Determination (No. 2) 2023 instructs to insert table item 210A after table item 210 in Part 2 of Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Brand” for table item 210A of Part 2 of Schedule 1 refers to “Flucelvax Quadri” rather than “Flucelvax Quad”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Flucelvax Quadri” and substitute “Flucelvax Quad” in the column headed “Brand” for table item 210A of Part 2 of Schedule 1 to correct the typographical error.
Superannuation (CSS) Salary Regulations 1978, Compilation No. 16, Registration Date: 27 November 2023 [F2023C01043]
Regulation 8B
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Regulation 8B refers to “not less that” rather than “not less than”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “not less that” and substitute “not less than” in regulation 8B to correct the typographical error.
Subparagraph 14(b)(i)
Kind of editorial change
Change to spelling
Details of editorial change
Subparagraph 14(b)(i) refers to “mininium” rather than “minimum”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “mininium” and substitute “minimum” in subparagraph 14(b)(i) to correct the spelling.
Australian Charities and Not‑for‑profits Commission Regulations 2022, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 22 November 2023 [F2023C01018]
Part 9.1 (heading)
Kind of editorial change
Renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering Part 9.1 as Part 9-1 to reflect the Part numbering within the rest of these regulations.
Medibank Private Sale Act 2006, Compilation No. 13, Registration Date: 14 November 2023 [C2023C00427]
Item 1 of Schedule 2 (definition of financial product)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 675 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 instructs to omit “Chapter 7” and substitute “Division 3 of Part 7.1” in the definition of financial product in clause 1 of Schedule 2.
Clause 1 of Schedule 2 does not appear. However, item 1 of Schedule 2 does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Chapter 7” and substitute “Division 3 of Part 7.1” in the definition of financial product in item 1 of Schedule 2 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Subitem 6(8) of Schedule 2 (definition of security)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 676 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 instructs to omit “Chapter 7 of” and substitute “subsection 92(5) of” in the definition of security in subclause 6(8) of Schedule 2.
Subclause 6(8) of Schedule 2 does not appear. However, subitem 6(8) of Schedule 2 does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Chapter 7 of” and substitute “subsection 92(5) of” in the definition of security in subitem 6(8) of Schedule 2 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Corporations Act 2001, Compilation No. 126, Registration Date: 13 November 2023 [C2023C00426]
Subsection 892D(7)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 413 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk149916394]413  Subsections 892D(7) and (8)
Omit “the relevant authority” (wherever occurring), substitute “the Part 7.5 authority”.
However, the words “The relevant authority” also appear in subsection 892D(7).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “The relevant authority” and substitute “the Part 7.5 authority” in subsection 892D(7) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Section 985A (heading)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 486 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk149728858]486  Section 985A (heading)
Repeal the heading.
[bookmark: _Toc150790590]985A  Meaning of contract of insurance and insured
The instruction to substitute the heading is missing.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the heading to section 985A and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Superannuation Contributions Tax (Assessment and Collection) Act 1997, Compilation No. 28, Registration Date: 7 November 2023 [C2023C00409]
Section 43
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of defined benefit member in section 43 to the correct alphabetical position.
Child Care Subsidy Minister’s Rules 2017, Compilation No. 41, Registration Date: 5 November 2023 [F2023C00956]
Paragraph 15(h)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Paragraph 15(h) ends in a full stop despite being followed by paragraph (i).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the full stop and substitute a semicolon at the end of paragraph 15(h) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Health Insurance Commission (Reform and Separation of Functions) Act 1997, Compilation No. 14, Registration Date: 28 October 2023 [C2023C00374]
Section 4
Kind of editorial change
[bookmark: _Hlk148950088]Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definitions of re‑transferred employee and transferred employee in section 4 to the correct alphabetical positions.
Australian Securities and Investments Commission Act 2001, Compilation No. 95, Registration Date: 25 October 2023 [C2023C00360]
Subparagraph 127(4)(aa)(ia)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 3 item 7 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (2023 Law Improvement Package No. 1) Act 2023 provides as follows:
7  Subparagraph 127(4)(aa)(i)
[bookmark: _Hlk148607952]Omit “(within the meaning of the Corporations Act 2001)”.
The text “(within the meaning of the Corporations Act 2001)” does not appear in subparagraph 127(4)(aa)(i). However, it does appear in subparagraph 127(4)(aa)(ia).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “(within the meaning of the Corporations Act 2001)” from subparagraph 127(4)(aa)(ia) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part‑time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 18 October 2023 [F2023C00921]
Part 8
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 16 of the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2023 instructs to add Part 8 at the end of the instrument.
This amendment results in Part 8 appearing after Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to move Part 8 after Part 7 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
National Health (Growth Hormone Program) Special Arrangement 2015 (PB 85 of 2015), Compilation No. 18, Registration Date: 17 October 2023 [F2023C00920]
Subsection 4(1) (paragraph (b) of the definition of ideal body weight)
Kind of editorial change
Change to spelling
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “multipled” and substitute “multiplied” in paragraph (b) of the definition of ideal body weight in subsection 4(1) to correct the spelling.
Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full‑time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 17 October 2023 [F2023C00918]
Part 6
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2023 instructs to add Part 6 at the end of the instrument.
This amendment results in Part 6 appearing after Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to move Part 6 after Part 5 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Military Rehabilitation and Compensation Act Education and Training Scheme 2004, Compilation No. 7, Registration Date: 14 October 2023 [F2023C00916]
Paragraph 1.2.1 (note to the definition of “responsible Departments”)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 1 of the Veterans’ Children Education Schemes Amendment (Increase in Education Allowance) Determination 2023 provides as follows:
1  Paragraph 1.2.1, definition of responsible departments, Note
Repeal the Note, substitute:
Note:	The Administrative Arrangements Order sets out Commonwealth Departments and the legislation they administer and could be viewed on the Federal Register of Legislation website (https://www.legislation.gov.au).
The definition of “responsible departments” does not appear in paragraph 1.2.1. However, the definition of “responsible Departments” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the note to the definition of “responsible Departments” in paragraph 1.2.1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Paragraph 3.8.1 (note 3)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to insert a colon after the text “Note 3” in paragraph 3.8.1 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Veterans’ Children Education Scheme, Compilation No. 9, Registration Date: 14 October 2023 [F2023C00917]
Paragraph 1.2.1 (note to the definition of “responsible Departments”)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Veterans’ Children Education Schemes Amendment (Increase in Education Allowance) Determination 2023 provides as follows:
1  Paragraph 1.2.1, definition of responsible departments, Note
Repeal the Note, substitute:
[bookmark: _Hlk147480764]Note:	The Administrative Arrangements Order sets out Commonwealth Departments and the legislation they administer and could be viewed on the Federal Register of Legislation website (https://www.legislation.gov.au).
The definition of “responsible departments” does not appear in paragraph 1.2.1. However, the definition of “responsible Departments” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the note to the definition of “responsible Departments” in paragraph 1.2.1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Paragraph 3.8
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 4 of the Veterans’ Children Education Schemes Amendment (Increase in Education Allowance) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute paragraph 3.8.
This amendment repeals the heading to paragraph 3.8 but does not replace it.
This compilation was editorially changed to reinsert the paragraph 3.8 heading and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Paragraph 3.8.1 (note 3)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to insert a colon after the text “Note 3” in paragraph 3.8.1 to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Determination 2022 (PB 98 of 2022), Compilation No. 10, Registration Date: 13 October 2023 [F2023C00909]
[bookmark: _Hlk147217815]Schedule 1, entry for Rasagiline
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 14 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 7) (PB 99 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Rasagline in Schedule 1.
There is no entry for Rasagline in Schedule 1. However, there is an entry for Rasagiline in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Rasagiline in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Crimes Act 1914, Compilation No. 149, Registration Date: 6 October 2023 [C2023C00279]
Paragraph 15LC(4)(db)
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 177 of the Inspector‑General of Intelligence and Security and Other Legislation Amendment (Modernisation) Act 2023 instructs to insert paragraph 15LC(4)(db) after paragraph 15LC(4)(d).
This amendment results in paragraph 15LC(4)(db) being out of alphabetical order.
This compilation was editorially changed to move paragraph 15LC(4)(db) to the correct alphabetical position.
Corporations Act 2001, Compilation No. 124, Registration Date: 5 October 2023 [C2023C00274]
Section 648B
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 41 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Modernising Business Communications and Other Measures) Act 2023 instructs to insert “(including the electronic address, if any)” after “address” in section 648B.
The word “address” appears twice in section 648B.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “(including the electronic address, if any)” after “address” (first occurring) in section 648B to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
National Health (Listing of Pharmaceutical Benefits) Instrument 2012 (PB 71 of 2012), Compilation No. 134, Registration Date: 4 October 2023 [F2023C00864]
[bookmark: _Hlk146275541]Schedule 4, Part 1, entries for Fenofibrate, Fluvastatin, Perindopril with indapamide, Pravastatin, Rosuvastatin, Simvastatin and Sulfasalazine
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 items 479, 480, 516, 519, 536, 538 and 540 of the National Health (Listing of Pharmaceutical Benefits) Amendment Instrument 2023 (No. 8) (PB 79 of 2023) refer to the Purposes Code C14141.
The Purposes Code C14141 does not appear. However, the Purposes Code P14141 does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to apply the amendments to the Purposes Code P14141 in the entries for Fenofibrate, Fluvastatin, Perindopril with indapamide, Pravastatin, Rosuvastatin, Simvastatin and Sulfasalazine in Part 1 of Schedule 4 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Foreign Acquisitions and Takeovers Act 1975, Compilation No. 30, Registration Date: 30 September 2023 [C2023C00263]
Paragraph 98E(1)(b)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 4 item 53 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Modernising Business Communications and Other Measures) Act 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk146091278]53  Subparagraph 98E(1)(b)
[bookmark: _Hlk146029385]After “core Part 3 actions”, insert “or exempt core Part 3 actions”.
This item refers to “Subparagraph 98E(1)(b)” rather than “Paragraph 98E(1)(b)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert “or exempt core Part 3 actions” after “core Part 3 actions” in paragraph 98E(1)(b) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Criminal Code Act 1995, Compilation No. 148, Registration Date: 27 September 2023 [C2023C00256]
Section 473.1 of the Criminal Code (paragraph (l) of the definition of law enforcement officer)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 10 item 5 of the Crimes and Other Legislation Amendment (Omnibus) Act 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute paragraph (l) of the definition of law enforcement officer in section 473.1 of the Criminal Code.
Subparagraph (l)(iv) ends in a full stop despite being followed by paragraph (m).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the full stop and substitute a semicolon at the end of subparagraph (l)(iv) of the definition of law enforcement officer in section 473.1 of the Criminal Code to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Export Control Act 2020, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 27 September 2023 [C2023C00258]
Paragraph 199(2)(ab)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 25 of the Export Control Amendment (Streamlining Administrative Processes) Act 2023 provides as follows:
25  After subparagraph 199(2)(a)
Insert:
	(ab)	to make the variation with additional conditions or variations of conditions; or
This item refers to “subparagraph 199(2)(a)” rather than “paragraph 199(2)(a)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert paragraph 199(2)(ab) after paragraph 199(2)(a) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Act 1993, Compilation No. 117, Registration Date: 27 September 2023 [C2023C00253]
Paragraph 29P(3)(aa) (first occurring)
Kind of editorial change
Renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 4 item 66 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Modernising Business Communications and Other Measures) Act 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute paragraph 29P(3)(a) and insert paragraph 29P(3)(aa).
Paragraph 29P(3)(aa) already appears in the subsection.
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the newly inserted, first occurring paragraph 29P(3)(aa) as paragraph 29P(3)(aaa).
International Transfer of Prisoners Act 1997, Compilation No. 10, Registration Date: 18 September 2023 [C2023C00237]
Subsection 4(1)
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of prison officer in subsection 4(1) to the correct alphabetical position.
Social Security (Approved Scholarship Courses) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 11 September 2023 [F2023C00797]
Section 6
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 4 of the Social Security (Approved Scholarship Courses) Amendment Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute section 6.
This amendment repeals the section heading but does not replace it.
This compilation was editorially changed to reinsert the section 6 heading and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
List of Exempt Native Specimens Instrument 2001, Compilation No. 402, Registration Date: 9 September 2023 [F2023C00791]
Schedule 1, entry for Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 of the Amendment of List of Exempt Native Specimens – Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery, August 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk144989559][bookmark: _Hlk121559764]Under the heading Freshwater and Marine Animals delete from the list the following items and any associated notations:
	Taxon/Item
	Common Name
	Notation

	Specimen that are, or are derived from, fish or invertebrates taken in the Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery as defined in the management regime in force under the Fisheries Act 1994 (Queensland) and Fisheries (General) Regulation 2019, Fisheries (Commercial Fisheries) Regulation 2019, Fisheries Declaration 2019 and Fisheries Quota Declaration 2019 (Queensland), but not including:
v.	specimens that belong to taxa listed under section 209 of the EPBC Act (Australia’s list of Migratory Species), or
vi.	specimens that belong to taxa listed under section 248 of the EPBC Act (Australia’s list of Marine Species), or
vii.	specimens that belong to eligible listed threatened species, as defined under section 303BC of the EPBC Act, or
viii.	iv. specimens that belong to taxa listed under section 303CA of the EPBC Act (Australia’s CITES List).
	Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery
	The specimen, or the fish or invertebrate from which it is derived, was taken lawfully; and
The specimens are covered by the declaration of an approved wildlife trade operation under section 303FN of the EPBC Act in relation to the fishery.


The text contained in the Taxon/Item column of the Schedule 1 entry for the Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 of the Amendment of List of Exempt Native Specimens – Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery, August 2023.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the Schedule 1 entry for the Queensland Commercial Trawl (Fin Fish) Fishery and give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Aboriginal Land and Waters (Jervis Bay Territory) Act 1986, Compilation No. 14, Registration Date: 6 September 2023 [C2023C00222]
Section 2
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “(1)” from section 2 to remove the redundant text and bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Industrial Chemicals Charges (Excise) Regulations 2020, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 6 September 2023 [F2023C00784]
Section 7
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Section 7 appears as follows:
[bookmark: _Toc144897162][bookmark: _Hlk144729062]7  Application of amendments made by the Industrial Chemicals Charges (Excise) Amendment Regulations 2023
	(1)	The amendments made by Part 1 of Schedule 1 to the Industrial Chemicals Charges (Excise) Amendment Regulations 2023 apply in relation to the registration of a person for a registration year beginning on 1 September 2023 and later registration years.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “(1)” from section 7 to remove the redundant text and bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Industrial Chemicals Charges (Customs) Regulations 2020, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 31 August 2023 [F2023C00775]
Section 4 and subsection 5(2)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Part 1 of Schedule 1 to the Industrial Chemicals Charges (Customs) Amendment Regulations 2023 provides as follows:
Schedule 1—Amendments
Part 1—Amendments
Industrial Chemical Charges (Customs) Regulations 2020
The title to be amended reads “Industrial Chemical Charges (Customs) Regulations 2020” rather than the correct title of “Industrial Chemicals Charges (Customs) Regulations 2020”.
This compilation was editorially changed by applying the amendments from Part 1 of Schedule 1 to the Industrial Chemicals Charges (Customs) Amendment Regulations 2023 to the Industrial Chemicals Charges (Customs) Regulations 2020 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Ombudsman Act 1976, Compilation No. 57, Registration Date: 31 August 2023 [C2023C00218]
Paragraph 20ZK(1)(h)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Paragraph 20ZK(1)(h) reads as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk143604769]	(h)	section 35AA (disclosure of information and documents to National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner);
However, the heading to section 35AA reads “Disclosure of information and documents to National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner or Inspector”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference by inserting “or Inspector” after “National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner” in paragraph 20ZK(1)(h).
Subsection 20ZS(1) (table item 10, column 1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Column 1 of table item 10 of subsection 20ZS(1) reads as follows:
		paragraph 35AA(1)(a) (disclosure of information and documents to National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner)
However, the heading to section 35AA reads “Disclosure of information and documents to National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner or Inspector”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference by inserting “or Inspector” after “National Anti‑Corruption Commissioner” in column 1 of table item 10 of subsection 20ZS(1).
Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 144, Registration Date: 30 August 2023 [F2023C00772]
Subregulation 9AB.12(6)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 41 of the Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Amendment (Your Future, Your Super—Addressing Underperformance in Superannuation) Regulations 2023 instructs to omit “the determination” and substitute “a determination under subregulation (5)” in subregulation 9AB.12(6).
The words “the determination” appear three times in subregulation 9AB.12(6).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “the determination” (first occurring) and substitute “a determination under subregulation (5)” in subregulation 9AB.12(6) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
[bookmark: _Hlk143851527]Paragraph 9AB.14(9)(a) (second occurring)
Kind of editorial change
Renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 51 of the Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Amendment (Your Future, Your Super—Addressing Underperformance in Superannuation) Regulations 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subregulation 9AB.14(9) and insert subregulation 9AB.14(9A).
The newly substituted subregulation 9AB.14(9) contains two paragraph (a)s.
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the second occurring paragraph 9AB.14(9)(a) as paragraph 9AB.14(9)(aa).
Subregulation 9AB.14(11)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 54 of the Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Amendment (Your Future, Your Super—Addressing Underperformance in Superannuation) Regulations 2023 instructs to omit “the determination” and substitute “a determination under subregulation (10)” in subregulation 9AB.14(11).
The words “the determination” appear three times in subregulation 9AB.14(11).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “the determination” (first occurring) and substitute “a determination under subregulation (10)” in subregulation 9AB.14(11) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Child Care Subsidy Minister’s Rules 2017, Compilation No. 40, Registration Date: 28 August 2023 [F2023C00765]
Section 4
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of registered training organisation in section 4 to the correct alphabetical position.
Migration Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 245, Registration Date: 23 August 2023 [F2023C00744]
Clause 836.213 of Schedule 2
[bookmark: _Hlk143092732]Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to insert a colon after the words “The applicant is sponsored” in clause 836.213 of Schedule 2 to correct the punctuation.
Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Determination 2014, Compilation No. 41, Registration Date: 18 August 2023 [F2023C00734]
Section 91
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 13) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation and Other Measures) Instrument 2023 instructs to omit “$44.24 for HMA” and substitute “$45.70” in section 91.
The text “$44.24 for HMA” does not appear in section 91. However, the text “$44.24” does appear in the definition of HMA in section 91.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$44.24” and substitute “$45.70” in the definition of HMA in section 91 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Section 92
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 14) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation and Other Measures) Instrument 2023 instructs to omit “$136.04 for B” and substitute “$140.53” in section 92.
The text “$136.04 for B” does not appear in section 92. However, the text “$136.04” does appear in the definition of B in section 92.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$136.04” and substitute “$140.53” in the definition of B in section 92 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Section 93
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 (table item 15) of the Aged Care Legislation Amendment (July Indexation and Other Measures) Instrument 2023 instructs to omit “$136.04 for B” and substitute “$140.53” in section 93.
The text “$136.04 for B” does not appear in section 93. However, the text “$136.04” does appear in the definition of B in section 93.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$136.04” and substitute “$140.53” in the definition of B in section 93 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Rules 2020, Compilation No. 8, Registration Date: 18 August 2023 [F2023C00735]
Subrule 1.7(1)
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of CDR representative principal in subrule 1.7(1) to the correct alphabetical position.
Subrule 1.7(1) (subparagraph (c)(ii) of the definition of secondary user)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 8 of the Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Amendment Rules (No. 1) 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk142310934]8  Subrule 1.7(1) (subparagraph (a)(ii) of the definition of secondary user)
[bookmark: _Hlk121822289]Omit “requrements”, substitute “requirements”.
Subparagraph (a)(ii) does not appear in the definition of secondary user in subrule 1.7(1). However, the text “requrements” does appear in subparagraph (c)(ii) of the definition of secondary user in subrule 1.7(1).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “requrements” and substitute “requirements” in subparagraph (c)(ii) of the definition of secondary user in subrule 1.7(1) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Subrules 1.22(3), (4) and (5), 1.23(4), (5) and (6) and 5.14(1) (notes)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 items 28 to 33 and 86 of the Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Amendment Rules (No. 1) 2023 instruct to omit “rule” and substitute “subrule” in the notes to subrules 1.22(3), (4) and (5), 1.23(4), (5) and (6) and 5.14(1).
The word “rule” appears twice in each note.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “rule” (first occurring) and substitute “subrule” in the notes to subrules 1.22(3), (4) and (5), 1.23(4), (5) and (6) and 5.14(1) to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Subrule 4.3A(5) (note)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 40 of the Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Amendment Rules (No. 1) 2023 instructs to omit “rule 4.18” and substitute “rule 4.20O” in the note to subrule 4.3A(5).
The text “rule 4.18” does not appear in the note to subrule 4.3A(5). However, the text “rule 4.18A” does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “rule 4.18A” and substitute “rule 4.20O” in the note to subrule 4.3A(5) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Subclause 2.1(2) of Schedule 3 (note)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 146 of the Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Amendment Rules (No. 1) 2023 instructs to omit “account holders” and substitute “users” in the note to subclause 2.1(2) of Schedule 3.
The words “account holders” appear twice in the note to subclause 2.1(2) of Schedule 3.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “account holders” (second occurring) and substitute “users” in the note to subclause 2.1(2) of Schedule 3 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Subclause 3.2(2) of Schedule 4
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 167 of the Competition and Consumer (Consumer Data Right) Amendment Rules (No. 1) 2023 provides as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk141886707]167  Subclauses 3.2(1), (2), (4) and (5) of Schedule 4 
[bookmark: _Hlk141886685][bookmark: _Hlk141872556]Omit “For”, substitute “In”.
The word “For” appears twice in subclause 3.2(2) of Schedule 4.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “For” (first occurring) and substitute “In” in subclause 3.2(2) of Schedule 4 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Child Care Subsidy Minister’s Rules 2017, Compilation No. 39, Registration Date: 17 August 2023 [F2023C00730]
Subparagraph 8(4B)(b)(ii)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 13 of the Child Care Subsidy Amendment (2023 Measures No. 1) Minister’s Rules 2023 instructs to repeal subparagraph 8(4B)(b)(vi) (not including the note).
The repeal of subparagraph 8(4B)(b)(vi) results in subparagraph 8(4B)(b)(ii) ending with a semicolon despite being the last subparagraph of that subsection.
This compilation was editorially changed by omitting the semicolon and inserting a full stop at the end of subparagraph 8(4B)(b)(ii) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
[bookmark: opcStartOfTOC]List of Exempt Native Specimens Instrument 2001, Compilation No. 400, Registration Date: 17 August 2023 [F2023C00728]
Schedule 1, entry for Approved aquaculture programs in New South Wales
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
The entry for Approved aquaculture programs in New South Wales in Schedule 1 provides as follows:
	Taxon / Item
	Common Name
	Notation

	Specimens that are or are derived from fish or invertebrates, other than specimens that belong to species listed under Part 13 of the EPBC Act (other than a species listed in the conservation dependent category) and specimens that belong to taxa listed under section 303CA of the EPBC Act (Australia’s CITES list), produced in aquaculture facilities operating in New South Wales in accordance with the Fisheries Management Act 1994 (NSW) and subordinate legislation.
	Approved aquaculture programs in New South Wales
	The specimen, or the fish or invertebrate form which it is derived, was taken lawfully; and
The specimens are included in the list until 30 November 2028.


The text in the Notation column reads “The specimen, or the fish or invertebrate form which it is derived” rather than “The specimen, or the fish or invertebrate from which it is derived”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “form” and substitute “from” in the Notation column of the Schedule 1 entry for Approved aquaculture programs in New South Wales to correct the typographical error.
Australian Education Regulations 2023, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 14 August 2023 [F2023C00719]
Paragraph 24A(e)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Australian Education Amendment (2023 Capital Funding) Regulations 2023 provides as follows:
1  At the end of section 24A
Add:
[bookmark: _Hlk142393913]	; and (e)	for 2023, 110.94%.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the comma and substitute an em rule in paragraph 24A(e) to correct the punctuation.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Transcatheter Aortic Valve Implantation) Determination 2018, Compilation No. 6, Registration Date: 4 August 2023 [F2023C00695]
Subsection 9(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to insert section 9 after section 8.
The newly inserted subsection 9(1) refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 9(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 12, Registration Date: 3 August 2023 [F2023C00692]
Subsection 8(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 4 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 8(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 8(1).
Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 5 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 provides, in part, as follows:
5	Indexation amendments of listed provisions
The items of the table in Schedule 3 listed in the following table are amended as set out in the table.
[...]
The listed table items do not appear in Schedule 3. However, they do appear in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to apply the amendments to the table items in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
National Health (Pharmaceutical Benefits) (Subsection 84C(7) Price) Determination 2019 (PB 113 of 2019), Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 1 August 2023 [F2023C00675]
Subparagraphs 6(1)(c)(i) and (ii)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the National Health (Pharmaceutical Benefits) (Subsection 84C(7) Price) Amendment Determination 2023 (PB 52 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute subparagraphs 6(1)(c)(i) and (ii).
The text in subparagraph 6(1)(c)(ii) does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 1 of the National Health (Pharmaceutical Benefits) (Subsection 84C(7) Price) Amendment Determination 2023 (PB 52 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute subparagraphs 6(1)(c)(i) and (ii) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging – Cardiac MRI for Myocarditis) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 28 July 2023 [F2023C00662]
Subsection 8(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 8 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 8(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 8(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox Injection) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 28 July 2023 [F2023C00659]
Subsection 7(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 6 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 7(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 7(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services—Transcatheter Mitral Valve Repair) Determination 2021, Compilation No. 2, Registration Date: 28 July 2023 [F2023C00660]
Subsection 7(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 7(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 7(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C Midwife and Nurse Practitioner Services) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 7, Registration Date: 28 July 2023 [F2023C00661]
Subsection 6A(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 4 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 6A(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 6A(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox, Dysport or Xeomin Injection) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 5, Registration Date: 27 July 2023 [F2023C00651]
Subsection 7(1)
Kind of editorial change
[bookmark: _Hlk122429388]Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 2 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 7(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 7(1).
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Extracorporeal Photopheresis) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 27 July 2023 [F2023C00649]
Subsection 7(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 5 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 7(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update the cross‑reference by omitting “subclause (2)” from subsection 7(1) and substituting “subsection (2)”.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services ‑ Optometric Services) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 4, Registration Date: 27 July 2023 [F2023C00655]
Subsection 16(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a reference of a law or a provision
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 3 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 16(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update a reference from “subclause (2)” to “subsection (2)” in subsection 16(1).
Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 143, Registration Date: 27 July 2023 [F2023C00656]
Division 2.6 of Part 2 (heading)
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 38 of the Treasury Laws Amendment (Financial Reporting and Auditing of Registrable Superannuation Entities) Regulations 2023 instructs to repeal regulations 2.37 and 2.38.
This amendment results in Division 2.6 of Part 2 containing no regulations.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the redundant Division 2.6 of Part 2 heading.
Health Insurance (Section 3C Cleft Lip and Cleft Palate Services) Determination 2020, Compilation No. 3, Registration Date: 25 July 2023 [F2023C00640]
Subsection 8(1)
Kind of editorial change
Update to a cross‑reference
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 1 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C Cleft Lip and Cleft Palate Services ‑ Indexation) Amendment Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subsection 8(1).
The newly substituted subsection refers to “subclause (2)” instead of “subsection (2)”.
This compilation was editorially changed to update the cross‑reference by omitting “subclause (2)” from subsection 8(1) and substituting “subsection (2)”.
National Health (Highly Specialised Drugs Program) Special Arrangement 2021 (PB 27 of 2021), Compilation No. 28, Registration Date: 25 July 2023 [F2023C00638]
Subparagraph 32(1)(c)(iv)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 29 of the National Health Legislation Amendment (Opioid Dependence Treatment and Maximum Dispensed Quantities) Instrument 2023 (PB 57 of 2023) provides as follows:
29  At the end of subsection 32(1)
Add:
	and (v)	if the benefit is a ready‑prepared pharmaceutical benefit and a dangerous drug—the dangerous drug fee.
This amendment results in the text “. and” appearing at the end of subparagraph 32(1)(c)(iv).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the full stop and substitute a semicolon in subparagraph 32(1)(c)(iv) to correct the punctuation.
Health Insurance (Allied Health Services) Determination 2014, Compilation No. 27, Registration Date: 24 July 2023 [F2023C00632]
Section 15A
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 3 of the Health Insurance Amendment (Mental Health Case Conferencing Services and Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to insert section 15A after subsection 15.
Subsection 15 does not appear. However, section 15 does appear.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert section 15A after section 15 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Crimes Act 1914, Compilation No. 145, Registration Date: 21 July 2023 [C2023C00182]
Subsection 15JE(2)
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 79 of the National Anti‑Corruption Commission (Consequential and Transitional Provisions) Act 2022 instructs to omit “a target agency” and substitute “the ACC, the Australian Federal Policy or the Immigration and Border Protection Department” in subsection 15JE(2).
Subsection 15JE(2) refers to “Australian Federal Policy” rather than “Australian Federal Police”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Australian Federal Policy” and substitute “Australian Federal Police” in subsection 15JE(2) to correct the typographical error.
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Other Medical Practitioner) Determination 2018, Compilation No. 17, Registration Date: 19 July 2023 [F2023C00615]
Subclause 1.6.2(5) of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 9 of the Health Insurance Amendment (Mental Health Case Conferencing Services and Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute subclause 1.6.2(5) in Schedule 2.
Subclause 1.6.2(5) does not appear in Schedule 2. However, subclause 1.6.2(5) does appear in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute subclause 1.6.2(5) in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Clause 1.6.3 of Schedule 1 (table)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 10 of the Health Insurance Amendment (Mental Health Case Conferencing Services and Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute the table at clause 1.6.3 in Schedule 2.
The table at clause 1.6.3 does not appear in Schedule 2. However, the table at clause 1.6.3 does appear in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to repeal and substitute the table at clause 1.6.3 in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Clause 1.6.4 of Schedule 1
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 11 of the Health Insurance Amendment (Mental Health Case Conferencing Services and Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to insert clause 1.6.4 after clause 1.6.3 in Schedule 2.
Clause 1.6.3 does not appear in Schedule 2. However, clause 1.6.3 does appear in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert clause 1.6.4 after clause 1.6.3 in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1 (table)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 12 of the Health Insurance Amendment (Mental Health Case Conferencing Services and Indexation) Determination 2023 instructs to insert table items 969, 971 to 973, 975 and 986 after table item 244 in Schedule 2.
Table item 244 does not appear in Schedule 2. However, table item 244 does appear in Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to insert table items 969, 971 to 973, 975 and 986 after table item 244 in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Veterans’ Entitlements Act 1986, Compilation No. 185, Registration Date: 17 July 2023 [C2023C00175]
Paragraph 5H(8)(zb)
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the redundant word “or” at the end of paragraph 5H(8)(zb) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Electoral and Referendum Regulation 2016, Compilation No. 13, Registration Date: 14 July 2023 [F2023C00590]
Section 11A
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
Section 11A appears as follows:
[bookmark: _Toc140250952][bookmark: _Hlk139015651]11A  Additional evidence of identity requirements
	(1)	For the purposes of paragraph 98AA(2)(d) of the Act, the following kinds of evidence of a person’s identity are prescribed:
	(a)	the evidence number included in a notice given to the person under section 37 of the Australian Citizenship Act 2007;
	(b)	if the person is covered by a medicare card—the person’s medicare number.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “(1)” from section 11A to remove the redundant text and bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Telecommunications Act 1997, Compilation No. 107, Registration Date: 14 July 2023 [C2023C00163]
Section 317B (paragraph (b) of the definition of interception agency)
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
The amendment made by Schedule 1 item 263 of the National Anti‑Corruption Commission (Consequential and Transitional Provisions) Act 2022 created two consecutive occurrences of “; or” at the end of paragraph (b) of the definition of interception agency in section 317B.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit one occurrence of “; or” to remove the redundant text.
Safety, Rehabilitation and Compensation (Defence‑related Claims) Act 1988, Compilation No. 12, Registration Date: 12 July 2023 [C2023C00151]
Section 123
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of 1971 amount in section 123 to the correct alphabetical position.
Child Support (Assessment) Act 1989, Compilation No. 64, Registration Date: 11 July 2023 [C2023C00144]
Paragraph 150E(3)(b)
Kind of editorial change
Change to spelling
Details of editorial change
Paragraph 150E(3)(b) reads as follows:
[bookmark: _Hlk118878666]	(b)	the Register is satisfied that the parents have ceased being members of the same couple;
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “Register” and substitute “Registrar” in paragraph 150E(3)(b) to correct the spelling.
Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Regulations 1994, Compilation No. 142, Registration Date: 11 July 2023 [F2023C00576]
Regulation 14.16 (second occurring)
Kind of editorial change
Renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
There are two regulation 14.16s in the Superannuation Industry (Supervision) Regulations 1994.
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the second occurring regulation 14.16 as regulation 14.16A.
Higher Education Support Act 2003, Compilation No. 88, Registration Date: 8 July 2023 [C2023C00133]
Subsection 128B‑40(3)
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 25 of the Education Legislation Amendment (Startup Year and Other Measures) Act 2023 instructs to add Part 3‑7 at the end of Chapter 3.
The newly inserted subsection 128B‑40(3) refers to “START‑UP HELP” rather than “STARTUP‑HELP”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “START‑UP HELP” and substitute “STARTUP‑HELP” in subsection 128B‑40(3) to correct the typographical error.
National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Determination 2022 (PB 98 of 2022), Compilation No. 7, Registration Date: 8 July 2023 [F2023C00563]
[bookmark: _Hlk139525869]Schedule 1, entry for Betamethasone
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 4 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Betamethasone in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Manner of administration” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 4 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Betamethasone in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1, entry for Betamethasone
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
In the Schedule 1 entry for Betamethasone in the form Cream 200 micrograms (as valerate) per g, 100 g, text appears in the second row rather than just the first row in the column headed “Manner of administration”.
This compilation was editorial changed to remove the second occurrence of “Application” from the column headed “Manner of administration” in the Schedule 1 entry for Betamethasone in the form Cream 200 micrograms (as valerate) per g, 100 g to remove the redundant text.
Schedule 1, entry for Irbesartan
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 7 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Irbesartan in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the columns headed “Listed drug”, “Form” and “Manner of administration” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 7 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Irbesartan in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1, entry for Irbesartan
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
In the Schedule 1 entry for Irbesartan, text appears in every row rather than just the first row of each entry in the columns headed “Listed drug”, “Form” and “Manner of administration”.
This compilation was editorial changed to remove:
· the second to sixth occurrences of “Irbesartan” from the column headed “Listed drug”;
· the second occurrence of “Tablet 75 mg”, “Tablet 150 mg” and “Tablet 300 mg” from the column headed “Form”; and
· the second, fourth and sixth occurrence of “Oral” from the column headed “Manner of administration”;
in the Schedule 1 entry for Irbesartan to remove the redundant text.
Schedule 1, entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 8 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the columns headed “Listed drug”, “Form” and “Manner of administration” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 8 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1, entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
In the Schedule 1 entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide, text appears in every row rather than just the first row of each entry in the columns headed “Listed drug”, “Form” and “Manner of administration”.
This compilation was editorial changed to remove:
· the second to sixth occurrences of “Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide” from the column headed “Listed drug”;
· the second occurrence of “Tablet 150 mg-12.5 mg”, “Tablet 300 mg-12.5 mg” and “Tablet 300 mg-25 mg” from the column headed “Form”; and
· the second, fourth and sixth occurrence of “Oral” from the column headed “Manner of administration”;
in the Schedule 1 entry for Irbesartan with hydrochlorothiazide to remove the redundant text.
Schedule 1, entry for Perindopril with indapamide
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 13 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Perindopril with indapamide in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Form” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 13 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Perindopril with indapamide in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1, entry for Perindopril with indapamide
Kind of editorial change
Correct a typographical error
Details of editorial change
The text contained in the column headed “Form” in the entry for Perindopril with indapamide in Schedule 1 refers to “Tablet containing perindopril arginine 2.5 mg with indapamide hemihydrate 0.625 m” rather than “Tablet containing perindopril arginine 2.5 mg with indapamide hemihydrate 0.625 mg”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “0.625 m” and substitute “0.625 mg” to correct the typographical error.
[bookmark: _Hlk138163833]Schedule 1, entry for Pravastatin
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 14 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit and substitute the entry for Pravastatin in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Manner of administration” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 14 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit and substitute the entry for Pravastatin in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Schedule 1, entry for Pravastatin
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
In the Schedule 1 entry for Pravastatin in the form Tablet containing pravastatin sodium 10 mg, text appears in the second row rather than just the first row in the column headed “Manner of administration”.
This compilation was editorial changed to remove the second occurrence of “Oral” from the column headed “Manner of administration” in the Schedule 1 entry for Pravastatin in the form Tablet containing pravastatin sodium 10 mg to remove the redundant text.
Schedule 1, entry for Ranitidine
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 15 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023) instructs to omit the entry for Ranitidine in Schedule 1.
The text contained in the column headed “Form” does not exactly match the text to be omitted as outlined in Schedule 1 item 15 of the National Health (Price and Special Patient Contribution) Amendment Determination 2023 (No. 4) (PB 50 of 2023).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the entry for Ranitidine in Schedule 1 to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Therapeutic Goods (Charges) Regulations 2018, Compilation No. 6, Registration Date: 8 July 2023 [F2023C00561]
Subparagraph 7(5)(f)(i)
Kind of editorial change
Removal of redundant text
Details of editorial change
[bookmark: bkSelection]Schedule 1 item 20 of the Therapeutic Goods (Charges) Amendment (2023 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2023 instructs to omit “172,984” and substitute “$192,185” in subparagraph 7(5)(f)(i).
This amendment results in two dollar signs before “192,185”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the first occurring dollar sign before “192,185” in subparagraph 7(5)(f)(i) to remove the redundant text.
Veterans’ Entitlements Act 1986, Compilation No. 184, Registration Date: 8 July 2023 [C2023C00137]
Subparagraph 5H(8)(zzd)(ii)
Kind of editorial change
Change to punctuation
Details of editorial change
Subparagraph 5H(8)(zzd)(ii) ends in a full stop despite being followed by paragraph (zze).
This compilation was editorially changed to omit the full stop and substitute a semicolon at the end of subparagraph 5H(8)(zzd)(ii) to bring it into line with legislative drafting practice.
Health Insurance (General Medical Services Table) Regulations 2021, Compilation No. 12, Registration Date: 4 July 2023 [F2023C00547]
Schedule 1 (items 51800 and 51803, column 2)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 18 of the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (2023 Measures No. 1) Regulations 2023 instructs to omit “$590.25” and substitute “$611.50” in column 2 of items 51800 and 51803 of Schedule 1.
The fee of “$590.25” appears twice in column 2 of items 51800 and 51803 of Schedule 1.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “$590.25” (wherever occurring) in column 2 of items 51800 and 51803 of Schedule 1 and substitute “$611.50” to give effect to the misdescribed amendments as intended.
Data Availability and Transparency Act 2022, Compilation No. 1, Registration Date: 1 July 2023 [C2023C00106]
Section 9
Kind of editorial change
Reordering of definitions
Details of editorial change
This compilation was editorially changed to move the definition of government entity in section 9 to the correct alphabetical position.
[bookmark: opcCurrentPosition]Fair Work Act 2009, Compilation No. 51, Registration Date: 1 July 2023 [C2023C00112]
Paragraph 78(3)(b)
Kind of editorial change
Give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended
Details of editorial change
Schedule 2 item 70 of the Fair Work Legislation Amendment (Protecting Worker Entitlements) Act 2023 provides as follows:
70  Subsection 78(3)(b)
Omit “a female employee”, substitute “an employee”.
This item refers to “Subsection” rather than “Paragraph”.
This compilation was editorially changed to omit “a female employee” and substitute “an employee” in paragraph 78(3)(b) to give effect to the misdescribed amendment as intended.
Public Interest Disclosure Act 2013, Compilation No. 15, Registration Date: 1 July 2023 [C2023C00111]
Subsection 43(4A) (second occurring)
Kind of editorial change
Renumbering of provisions
Details of editorial change
Schedule 1 item 11 of the Public Interest Disclosure Amendment (Review) Act 2023 instructs to repeal and substitute sections 43 and 44 and insert section 44A.
The newly substituted section 43 contains subsection 43(4A).
Schedule 4 item 12 of the Public Interest Disclosure Amendment (Review) Act 2023 instructs to insert subsection 43(4A) after subsection 43(4).
These amendments result in two subsection (4A)s in section 43.
This compilation was editorially changed by renumbering the second occurring subsection 43(4A) as subsection 43(4B).
________________________________________________________________________________________________________________
28 Sydney Avenue  Forrest  ACT  2603
Locked Bag 30 Kingston ACT 2604 • Telephone (02) 6120 1400 • Fax (02) 6120 1403 • ABN 41 425 630 817
www.opc.gov.au
S23ZD1611.v24.docx
[S23ZD1611.v24.docx] [22-Dec-23] [4:14 PM]		Page  2
image1.jpeg
Australian Government

Office of Parliamentary Counsel





