Remuneration Tribunal Amendment
Determination (No. 4) 2025

We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination.

Dated 16 August 2025

Signed Signed Signed
Holly Kramer Heather Zampatti Stephen Conry AM
President Member Member
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Authorised Version F20251.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Contents

1 INAITIC ...ttt ettt e st e e et e e beesbeesbeesbeeaseesaeessesssenssenseenseenseensaens
2 COMMENCEIMENL........eeuieiieiietiente et ete et et et e eatesetesteesteessee st enbeeteenseensesnsesatesenesseenseas
3 AUTNOTILY .ttt ettt ettt et
4 SCREAUIES......cviieiictieeteee ettt ettt ev e et e et e esbeeaseesaesasessaeeseereereans

Schedule 1—Amendments

Part 1—References to the official travel determination

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration and
Allowances) Determination 2025

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time
Public Office) Determination 2025

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time
Public Office) Determination 2025

Part 2—Amendments commencing 7 September 2025

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration and
Allowances) Determination 2025

Part 3—Amendments commencing the day after registration 4

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time
Public Office) Determination 2025 4

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time
Public Office) Determination 2025

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F20251.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Authorised Version F20251.00944 registered 20/08/2025



1 Name

This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4)
2025.

2 Commencement

(1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences,
or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any
other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

Commencement information

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Provisions Commencement Date/Details

1. Sections 1 to 4 and The day after this instrument is registered. 21 August 2025
anything in this

instrument not
elsewhere covered by

this table
2. Schedule I, Part 1 ~ Immediately after the commencement of the 12.01 am (A.C.T.)
Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) 7 September 2025
Determination 2025.
3. Schedule 1, Part2 7 September 2025. 7 September 2025
4. Schedule 1, Part 3 The day after this instrument is registered. 21 August 2025
Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will

not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.

(2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument.
Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in
any published version of this instrument.

3 Authority

This instrument is made under subsections 7(3), (3AA), (4) and (4B) of the
Remuneration Tribunal Act 1973.

4 Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025 1
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F20251.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 References to the official travel determination

Schedule 1—Amendments
Part 1—References to the official travel determination

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration
and Allowances) Determination 2025

1 Section 7 (definition of official travel determination)

Omit “Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2024”, substitute
“Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2025”.

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Full-time Public Office) Determination 2025

2 Section 7 (definition of official travel determination)

Omit “Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2024”, substitute
“Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2025”.

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Part-time Public Office) Determination 2025

3 Section 8 (definition of official travel determination)

Omit “Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2024”, substitute
“Remuneration Tribunal (Official Travel) Determination 2025”.

2 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Amendments commencing 7 September 2025 Part 2

Part 2—Amendments commencing 7 September 2025

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration
and Allowances) Determination 2025

4 Subsection 39(1)
Omit “$40,110”, substitute “$40,630”.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025 3
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 3 Amendments commencing the day after registration

Part 3—Amendments commencing the day after registration

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Full-time Public Office) Determination 2025

5 Section7

Insert:

Table 64 means the table of application and transitional provisions in section 23.

6 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with President,
Australian Human Rights Commission)

Insert:

Director-General, Australian Naval Nuclear $502,180 1
Power Safety Regulator

7 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Data Standards
Chair)

Insert:

Defence and Veterans’ Services $486,400 2
Commissioner

8 Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Principal Member,
Veterans’ Review Board, column 2)

Omit “$376,640”, substitute “$408,020”.

9 Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Principal Member,
Veterans’ Review Board, column 3)

Insert “Table 6A, item 1.

10 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Commissioner,
Australian Charities and Not for profits Commission)

Insert:

Deputy Director-General, Australian Naval $376,640 1
Nuclear Power Safety Regulator

11 Subsection 15(2) (Table 3B, table item 5)
Repeal the item.

12 Subsection 15(2) (Table 3B, table item 11, column 2)
Omit “$309,780”, substitute “$323,500”.

13 Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, table item 1)
Repeal the item.

14 Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, table item 1)
Repeal the item.

4 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Amendments commencing the day after registration Part 3

15 After Part 5

Insert:

Part 6—Application and transitional provisions

23 Application and transitional provisions

The following table (Table 6A4) sets out application and transitional provisions
for the provisions in column 1.

Table 6A—Application and transitional provisions

Column 1 Column 2

Item Provision Application and transitional provisions

1 Table 2A, item dealing with This item, as amended by the Remuneration Tribunal
Principal Member, Veterans’ Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025, applies on and
Review Board after 1 July 2025.

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Part-time Public Office) Determination 2025

16 Section 16 (Table 3A, after table item dealing with Murray Darling
Basin Authority)

Insert:

Special Broadcasting Table 3B,
Service $134,990 $94,190 $67,600 item 2 1

17 Section 16 (Table 3A, table item dealing with Special Broadcasting
Service)

Repeal the item.

18 Section 16 (Table 3A, table item dealing with Australian Renewable
Energy Agency, column 5)

Omit “item 37, substitute “items 3 and 22”.

19 Section 17 (Table 3B, at the end of the table)

Add:
Ms Marianna O’Gorman is to receive, while she occupies the offices
) of both Deputy Chair of the Australian Renewable Energy Agency
- ﬁustrah;rll . and member of the Agency’s audit committee, fees of:
AegI:]\;V; © hnergy (a) for the period 4 March 2025 to 30 June 2025—3$5,480 per year;

and
(b) on and after 1 July 2025—85,620 per year.

20 Section 22 (Table 4A, after table item dealing with Geographical
Indication Committee)

Insert:

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025 5
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 3 Amendments commencing the day after registration

Sydney Airport Demand

Management Compliance

Committee $1,010 $908

6 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 4) 2025
OPC67483 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00944 registered 20/08/2025



