
Schedule 1  Amendments
  

Amendments  Schedule 1
  

[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination.
Dated	16 August 2025

	Signed
	Signed
	[bookmark: _GoBack]Signed

	Holly Kramer
	Heather Zampatti
	Stephen Conry AM

	President
	Member
	Member




  
  




OPC67484 - A
OPC67484 - A

OPC67484 - A
Contents
1	Name	1
2	Commencement	1
3	Authority	1
4	Schedules	1
Schedule 1—Amendments	2
Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Determination 2024	2






	ii
	Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
	


OPC67484 - A

	
	Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
	i


OPC67484 - A
[bookmark: _Toc206154887]1  Name
		This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025.
[bookmark: _Toc206154888]2  Commencement
	(1)	Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

	Commencement information

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Provisions
	Commencement
	Date/Details

	1.  The whole of this instrument
	7 September 2025.
	7 September 2025


Note:	This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.
	(2)	Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in any published version of this instrument.
[bookmark: _Toc206154889]3  Authority
		This instrument is made under sections 45, 46 and 46A of the Parliamentary Business Resources Act 2017.
[bookmark: _Toc206154890]4  Schedules
		Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc206154891]Schedule 1—Amendments
  
[bookmark: _Toc206154892]Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Determination 2024
1  Paragraph 5.2(a)
Omit “$627”, substitute “$641”.
2  Paragraph 5.5(a)
Omit “$218”, substitute “$223”.
3  Section 5.5A
Omit “if the member is mentioned in paragraph 5.2(a) or (b)—$218”, substitute “if the member is mentioned in paragraph 5.2(a) or (b)—$223”.
4  Section 5.5A
Omit “otherwise—$199”, substitute “otherwise—$203”.
5  Schedule B (table)
Repeal the table, substitute:

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Locality
	Members mentioned in Clause 5.2(b)
	Other members

	Capital cities

	Canberra
	$322
	$322

	Adelaide
	$432
	$413

	Brisbane
	$478
	$459

	Darwin
	$514
	$495

	Hobart
	$456
	$437

	Melbourne
	$486
	$433

	Perth
	$486
	$447

	Sydney
	$518
	$499

	Unspecified locations

	Locations not specified in this Table
	$428
	$363

	New South Wales

	Albury
	$428
	$409

	Armidale
	$428
	$368

	Bathurst
	$428
	$409

	Bega
	$428
	$409

	Bourke
	$428
	$386

	Broken Hill
	$428
	$364

	Cobar
	$428
	$409

	Coffs Harbour
	$428
	$409

	Cooma
	$428
	$409

	Cowra
	$428
	$409

	Dubbo
	$428
	$372

	Goulburn
	$428
	$367

	Gosford
	$428
	$363

	Grafton
	$428
	$374

	Griffith
	$428
	$362

	Gunnedah
	$428
	$382

	Inverell
	$428
	$409

	Lismore
	$428
	$385

	Maitland
	$428
	$389

	Mudgee
	$428
	$408

	Muswellbrook
	$428
	$362

	Narrabri
	$428
	$409

	Newcastle
	$428
	$397

	Nowra
	$428
	$370

	Orange
	$428
	$417

	Port Macquarie
	$428
	$392

	Tamworth
	$428
	$409

	Taree
	$428
	$409

	Tumut
	$428
	$409

	Wagga Wagga
	$428
	$379

	Wollongong
	$428
	$384

	Northern Territory

	Alice Springs
	$428
	$408

	Jabiru
	$437
	$418

	Katherine
	$449
	$430

	Nhulunbuy
	$485
	$466

	Tennant Creek
	$428
	$409

	Yulara
	$791
	$772

	Queensland

	Ayr
	$428
	$409

	Bundaberg
	$428
	$386

	Cairns
	$428
	$377

	Charters Towers
	$428
	$370

	Chinchilla
	$428
	$409

	Dalby
	$428
	$403

	Emerald
	$428
	$381

	Gladstone
	$428
	$373

	Gold Coast
	$446
	$427

	Hervey Bay
	$428
	$377

	Horn Island
	$566
	$547

	Innisfail
	$428
	$409

	Kingaroy
	$428
	$382

	Mackay
	$428
	$368

	Maryborough
	$428
	$409

	Mount Isa
	$428
	$387

	Nambour
	$428
	$365

	Rockhampton
	$428
	$376

	Roma
	$428
	$384

	Thursday Island
	$544
	$525

	Toowoomba
	$428
	$363

	Townsville
	$428
	$376

	Weipa
	$459
	$440

	South Australia

	Bordertown
	$428
	$366

	Ceduna
	$428
	$358

	Kadina
	$428
	$409

	Mount Gambier
	$428
	$366

	Naracoorte
	$428
	$409

	Port Augusta
	$428
	$409

	Port Lincoln
	$428
	$372

	Port Pirie
	$428
	$409

	Renmark
	$428
	$409

	Whyalla
	$428
	$369

	Wilpena Pound
	$493
	$474

	Tasmania

	Burnie
	$428
	$380

	Devonport
	$428
	$364

	Launceston
	$428
	$376

	Queenstown
	$428
	$409

	Victoria

	Ararat
	$428
	$361

	Bairnsdale
	$428
	$378

	Ballarat
	$428
	$389

	Benalla
	$428
	$370

	Bendigo
	$428
	$372

	Bright
	$428
	$382

	Castlemaine
	$428
	$364

	Colac
	$428
	$409

	Echuca
	$428
	$409

	Geelong
	$428
	$377

	Hamilton
	$428
	$372

	Horsham
	$428
	$368

	Mildura
	$428
	$372

	Portland
	$428
	$365

	Sale
	$428
	$409

	Seymour
	$428
	$366

	Shepparton
	$428
	$369

	Swan Hill
	$428
	$383

	Wangaratta
	$428
	$388

	Warrnambool
	$428
	$377

	Wodonga
	$428
	$409

	Wonthaggi
	$428
	$390

	Western Australia

	Albany
	$428
	$395

	Broome
	$446
	$427

	Bunbury
	$428
	$380

	Carnarvon
	$428
	$376

	Dampier
	$428
	$401

	Derby
	$428
	$394

	Esperance
	$428
	$382

	Exmouth
	$456
	$437

	Geraldton
	$428
	$392

	Halls Creek
	$428
	$406

	Kalgoorlie
	$428
	$395

	Karratha
	$509
	$490

	Kununurra
	$443
	$424

	Newman
	$492
	$473

	Northam
	$441
	$422

	Port Hedland
	$487
	$468

	External Territories

	Christmas Island
	$439
	$420

	Cocos (Keeling) Islands
	$552
	$533

	Norfolk Island
	$477
	$458




	
	Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
	2


OPC67484 - A

	6
	Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
	


OPC67484 - A

	
	Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2025
	5


OPC67484 - A
image1.jpg




