Migration Amendment (Visa Application
Charges) Regulations 2025

I, the Honourable Sam Mostyn AC, Governor-General of the Commonwealth of Australia,
acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, make the following regulations.

Dated 26 June 2025

Sam Mostyn AC
Governor-General

By Her Excellency’s Command

Tony Burke
Minister for Immigration and Citizenship

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Authorised Version F2025L.00796 registered 30/06/2025



Contents

1 INAITIE .ttt b bbb ettt b e bbbt bttt ettt 1

2 COMMENCEIMENL.......eiuiiiiieriinieiieeit ettt ettt s saesae bbb eae b snes 1

3 AUTNOTILY .ttt ettt ettt et 1

4 SCREAUIES. ...ttt ettt b s b ettt et ene et e ensenaenaens 1

Schedule 1—Amendments 2
Part 1—Visa application charge 2
Migration Regulations 1994 2

Part 2—Application of amendments 16
Migration Regulations 1994 16

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 i

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Authorised Version F2025L.00796 registered 30/06/2025



1 Name

This instrument is the Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges)
Regulations 2025.

2 Commencement

(1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences,
or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any
other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

Commencement information

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Provisions Commencement Date/Details
1. The whole of this 1 July 2025. 1 July 2025
instrument

Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will

not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.

(2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument.
Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, i
any published version of this instrument.

=]

3 Authority

This instrument is made under the Migration Act 1958.

4 Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 1
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L.00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

Schedule 1—Amendments
Part 1—Visa application charge

Migration Regulations 1994

1 Paragraph 1104BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 4007, substitute “$3 5007,

2 Paragraph 1104BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 7057, substitute “$1 755”.

3 Paragraph 1104BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$850”, substitute “$875”.

4 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 9807,

5 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

6 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

7 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 1407, substitute “$3 235”.

8 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 5707, substitute “$1 615”.

9 Subparagraph 1108(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$790”, substitute “$810”.

10 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 980”.

11 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

12 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

13 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 1407, substitute “$3 235”.

14 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 5707, substitute “$1 6157,

2 Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

15 Subparagraph 1108A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$790”, substitute “$810”".

16 Paragraph 1113(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 8407, substitute “$4 985”.

17 Paragraph 1113(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 4257, substitute “$2 4957,

18 Paragraph 1113(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2107, substitute “$1 2507,

19 Paragraph 1114B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 910”.

20 Paragraph 1114B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

21 Paragraph 1114B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 230”.

22 Paragraph 1114C(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 910”.

23 Paragraph 1114C(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

24 Paragraph 1114C(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 2307,

25 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 6657, substitute “$4 805”.

26 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3307, substitute “$2 400”.

27 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1657, substitute “$1 2007,

28 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 6657, substitute “$4 805”.

29 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 330”, substitute “$2 400”.

30 Subparagraph 1118A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1657, substitute “$1 200”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 3
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$2 1157, substitute “$2 175”.

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 0607, substitute “$1 090”.

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$530”, substitute “$545”.

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$5 1257, substitute “$5 280”.

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 5657, substitute “$2 640”.

Subparagraph 1123A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2857, substitute “$1 325”.

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$2 1157, substitute “$2 175”.

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 0607, substitute “$1 090”.

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$530”, substitute “$545”.

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$5 1257, substitute “$5 2807,

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 5657, substitute “$2 640”.

Subparagraph 1123B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2857, substitute “$1 325”.

Paragraph 1124(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$5 1257, substitute “$5 2807,

Paragraph 1124(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 5657, substitute “$2 6407,

Paragraph 1124(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 285”, substitute “$1 325”.

Paragraph 1124A(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$5 1257, substitute “$5 280”.

4

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

47 Paragraph 1124A(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 5657, substitute “$2 640”.

48 Paragraph 1124A(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2857, substitute “$1 325”.

49 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$545”, substitute “$560”.

50 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$270”, substitute “$280”.

51 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$140”, substitute “$145”.

52 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 980”.

53 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

54 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

55 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 980”.

56 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

57 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

58 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 5157, substitute “$1 560”.

59 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$760”, substitute “$785”.

60 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$380”, substitute “$390”.

61 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(va) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 5157, substitute “$1 560”.

62 Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(va) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$760”, substitute “$785”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 5
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

63

64

65

66

67

68

69

70

7

72

73

74

75

76

77

78

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(va) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$380”, substitute “$390”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 980”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(via) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 9207, substitute “$1 980”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(via) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$960”, substitute “$990”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(via) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$9 095”, substitute “$9 365”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$4 5507, substitute “$4 685”.

Subparagraph 1124B(2)(a)(vii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$2 2807, substitute “$2 345”.

Paragraph 1128(2)(a) of Schedule 1
Omit “$475”, substitute “$490”.

Subparagraph 1129(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$9 0957, substitute “$9 365”.

Subparagraph 1129(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$4 5507, substitute “$4 685”.

Subparagraph 1129(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$2 2807, substitute “$2 345”.

Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

6

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

79 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

80 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

81 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

82 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

83 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

84 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

85 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

86 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 140”, substitute “$3 235”.

87 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 5707, substitute “$1 615”.

88 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$790”, substitute “$810”.

89 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 8957, substitute “$5 040”.

90 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 6507, substitute “$1 700”.

91 Subparagraph 1130(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$830”, substitute “$855”.

92 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

93 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225.

94 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 7
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

95 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

96 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

97 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

98 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

99 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

100 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

101 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 8957, substitute “$5 0407,

102 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 445”, substitute “$2 515”.

103 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2257, substitute “$1 260”.

104 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 8957, substitute “$5 0407,

105 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 445”, substitute “$2 515”.

106 Subparagraph 1130A(2)(a)(vi) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2257, substitute “$1 260”.

107 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$490”, substitute “$505”.

108 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$245”, substitute “$250”.

109 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$125”, substitute “$130”.

110 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 4507, substitute “$4 585”.

8 Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

111 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 2257, substitute “$2 2907,

112 Subparagraph 1136(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1107, substitute “$1 145”.

113 Subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7657, substitute “$4 910”.

114 Subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

115 Subitem 1137(3) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1957, substitute “$1 230”.

116 Subitem 1137(4J) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7657, substitute “$4 910”.

117 Subitem 1137(4J) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

118 Subitem 1137(4J) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1957, substitute “$1 230”.

119 Paragraph 1138(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 910”.

120 Paragraph 1138(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

121 Paragraph 1138(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 2307,

122 Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$490”, substitute “$505”.

123 Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$245”, substitute “$250”.

124 Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$125”, substitute “$130”.

125 Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7657, substitute “$4 910”.

126 Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3807, substitute “$ 2 450”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 9
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

127

128

129

130

131

132

133

134

135

136

137

138

139

140

141

142

Subparagraph 1139(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1957, substitute “$1 230”.

Subparagraph 1140(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$325”, substitute “$335”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 1707, substitute “$1 205”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$590”, substitute “$605”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$295”, substitute “$305”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$14 2407, substitute “$14 670”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$7 1207, substitute “$7 335”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$3 5657, substitute “$3 670”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ic) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$6 5707, substitute “$6 765”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ic) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$3 2857, substitute “$3 385”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ic) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 6407, substitute “$1 690”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$9 7107, substitute “$10 000”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$4 8557, substitute “$5 000”.

Subparagraph 1202B(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$2 4307, substitute “$2 5007,

Paragraph 1211(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 1407, substitute “$3 235”.

Paragraph 1211(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 5707, substitute “$1 615”.

10

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

143

144

145

146

147

148

149

150

151

152

153

154

155

156

157

158

Paragraph 1211(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$790”, substitute “$810”".

Paragraph 1212B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$490”, substitute “$505”.

Paragraph 1212B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$250”, substitute “$255”.

Paragraph 1212B(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$120”, substitute “$125”.

Subparagraph 1214A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$370”, substitute “$380”".

Subparagraph 1214A(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$185”, substitute “$190”.

Paragraph 1214BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$430”, substitute “$445”.

Paragraph 1214BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$220”, substitute “$225”.

Paragraph 1214BA(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Paragraph 1215(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$9 0957, substitute “$9 365”.

Paragraph 1215(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$4 5507, substitute “$4 635”.

Paragraph 1215(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$2 2807, substitute “$2 345”.

Paragraph 1217(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$485”, substitute “$500”.

Paragraph 1217(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$245”, substitute “$250”.

Paragraph 1217(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$120”, substitute “$125”.

Subparagraph 1221(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$3 3007, substitute “$3 395”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025

11



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

159 Subparagraph 1221(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 6507, substitute “$1 7007,

160 Subparagraph 1221(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$830, substitute “$855”.

161 Subparagraph 1221A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 8957, substitute “$5 0407,

162 Subparagraph 1221A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$ 2 445, substitute “$2 515”.

163 Subparagraph 1221A(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 2257, substitute “$1 260”.

164 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$710”, substitute “$730”.

165 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$530”, substitute “$545”.

166 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ia) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$175”, substitute “$180”.

167 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$1 6007, substitute “$2 000”.

168 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 225”.

169 Subparagraph 1222(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$390”, substitute “$400”.

170 Subparagraph 1224A(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1
Omit “$650”, substitute “$670”.

171 Subparagraph 1225(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1
Omit “$650”, substitute “$670”.

172 Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$880”, substitute “$905”.

173 Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$440”, substitute “$455”.

174 Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$225”, substitute “$230”.

12 Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

175

176

177

178

179

180

181

182

183

184

185

186

187

188

189

190

Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$2 2357, substitute “$2 3007,

Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$1 1157, substitute “$1 150”.

Subparagraph 1229(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$560”, substitute “$580”.

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$425”, substitute “$435”.

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$210”, substitute “$220”.

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 9107,

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 385”, substitute “$2 455”.

Subparagraph 1230(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 230”.

Subparagraph 1231(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$415”, substitute “$430”.

Subparagraph 1231(2)(a)(v) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Subparagraph 1234(2)(a)(iia) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$345”, substitute “$355”.

Subparagraph 1234(2)(a)(iia) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$335”, substitute “$345”.

Subparagraph 1234(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$365”, substitute “$375”.

Subparagraph 1236(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1
Omit “$490”, substitute “$500”.

Subparagraph 1236(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1
Omit “$195”, substitute “$200”.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 13

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 1 Visa application charge

191

192

193

194

195

196

197

198

199

200

201

202

203

204

205

206

Paragraph 1236(2)(aa) of Schedule 1
Omit “$1 4357, substitute “$1 4807,

Subparagraph 1237(2)(a)(iii) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Subparagraph 1237(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$415”, substitute “$430”.

Subparagraph 1237(2)(a)(iv) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Paragraph 1238(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$415”, substitute “$430”.

Paragraph 1238(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$105”, substitute “$110”.

Paragraph 1239(2)(a) of Schedule 1
Omit “$1 1807, substitute “$1 215”.

Paragraph 1239(2)(b) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7157, substitute “$4 855”.

Paragraph 1239(2)(b) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$10 605, substitute “$10 925”.

Subparagraph 1240(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table items 1 and 2)
Omit “$3 1157, substitute “$3 2107,

Subparagraph 1240(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$780”, substitute “$805”.

Paragraph 1241(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 910”.

Paragraph 1241(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 4557,

Paragraph 1241(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 2307,

Paragraph 1242(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$4 7707, substitute “$4 910”.

Paragraph 1242(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 2)
Omit “$2 3857, substitute “$2 455”.

14

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Amendments Schedule 1
Visa application charge Part 1

207 Paragraph 1242(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 3)
Omit “$1 1907, substitute “$1 2307,

208 Paragraph 1302(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$185”, substitute “$190”.

209 Paragraph 1401(2)(a) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$45”, substitute “$50.

210 Subparagraph 1402(2)(a)(i) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$550”, substitute “$570”.

211 Subparagraph 1403(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$45”, substitute “$50”.

212 Subparagraph 1404(2)(a)(ii) of Schedule 1 (table item 1)
Omit “$45”, substitute “$50.

Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 15
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



Schedule 1 Amendments
Part 2 Application of amendments

Part 2—Application of amendments

Migration Regulations 1994
213 In the appropriate position in Schedule 13

Insert:

Part 154—Amendments made by the Migration Amendment
(Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025

15401 Operation of amendments

The amendments made by Part 1 of Schedule 1 to the Migration Amendment
(Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025 apply in relation to visa
applications made on or after 1 July 2025.

16 Migration Amendment (Visa Application Charges) Regulations 2025
OPC67378 - B

Authorised Version F2025L00796 registered 30/06/2025



