
OPC67426 - A

Remuneration Tribunal (Members of 
Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 2) 
2025

We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination.

Dated 18 June 2025

Signed Signed Signed
Holly Kramer Heather Zampatti Stephen Conry AM

President Member Member

  
  

Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025



Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025



Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 2) 
2025

i

OPC67426 - A

Contents
1 Name .............................................................................................................................1
2 Commencement.............................................................................................................1
3 Authority .......................................................................................................................1
4 Schedules.......................................................................................................................1

Schedule 1—Amendments 2

Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Determination 2024 2

Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025



Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025



  
  

Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 2) 
2025

1

OPC67426 - A

1  Name

This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) 
Amendment Determination (No. 2) 2025.

2  Commencement

(1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, 
or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any 
other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

Commencement information
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Provisions Commencement Date/Details
1.  The whole of this 
instrument

1 July 2025. 1 July 2025

Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will 
not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.

(2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. 
Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in 
any published version of this instrument.

3  Authority

This instrument is made under the sections 45, 46 and 46A of the Parliamentary 
Business Resources Act 2017.

4  Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or 
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any 
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025



Schedule 1  Amendments
  

2 Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Amendment Determination (No. 2) 
2025

OPC67426 - A

Schedule 1—Amendments
  

Remuneration Tribunal (Members of Parliament) Determination 2024

1  Section 2.1
Omit “$233,660”, substitute “$239,270”.

2  Section 2.2
Omit “$48,790”, substitute “$49,970”.

3  Section 2.3 (note)
Omit “$175,250 per annum, being 75% of the base salary of $233,660”, substitute 
“$179,460 per annum, being 75% of the base salary of $239,270”.

Authorised Version F2025L00713 registered 24/06/2025


