





[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025
I, Nigel Murray, delegate of the Minister for Health and Aged Care, make the following Determination.
Dated	28 April 2025




Nigel Murray
Assistant Secretary
MBS Policy and Specialist Programs Branch
Medicare Benefits and Digital Health Division
Health Resourcing Group
Department of Health and Aged Care 

_______________________________________________________________________







	



	



	



Contents
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_2]1  Name	1
2  Commencement	1
3  Authority	1
4  Schedules	1
Schedule 1—Indexation provision amendments	2
[bookmark: _Hlk195192896]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services –Transcatheter Aortic Valve Implantation) Determination 2018	2
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox, Dysport or Xeomin Injection) Determination 2020	2
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services - Optometric Services) Determination 2020	2
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Extracorporeal Photopheresis) Determination 2020	2
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox Injection) Determination 2020	3
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Transcatheter Mitral Valve Repair) Determination 2021	3
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Extracorporeal Photopheresis for Chronic Graft Versus Host Disease) Determination 2022	3
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Cleft and Craniofacial Services) Determination 2024	4
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Heart Health Assessment No.2) Determination 2019	4
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Other Medical Practitioner) Determination 2018	4
Health Insurance (Section 3C Midwife and Nurse Practitioner Services) Determination 2020	4
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Allied Health Services) Determination 2024	5
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Determination 2021	5
Schedule 2—Indexation amendments	6
[bookmark: _Hlk195194635]Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Whole Body Magnetic Resonance Imaging Scan) Determination 2022	6
Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services — Artificial Bowel Sphincter Services) Determination 2023	6
Health Insurance (Section 3C Co‑Dependent Pathology Services) Determination 2018	6
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging – Conjunctive Thallium-201 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2023	6
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Conjunctive Gallium-67 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2022	7
Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Cardiac MRI for Myocarditis) Determination 2024	7






	ii
	Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025
	

	




	
	Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025
	i

	



[bookmark: _Toc194047398]1  Name
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_3]		This instrument is the Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025.
[bookmark: _Toc194047399]2  Commencement
	(1)	Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

	Commencement information

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Provisions
	Commencement
	Date/Details

	1. The whole of this instrument
	[bookmark: _Hlk195280951]Immediately after schedules 1, 2, and 3 of the Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Amendment (Specialist Items and Other Changes) Determination 2025.
	1 July 2025


Note:	This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.
	(2)	Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in any published version of this instrument.
[bookmark: _Toc194047400]3  Authority
		This instrument is made under subsection 3C(1) of the Health Insurance Act 1973.
[bookmark: _Toc194047401]4  Schedules
		Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc194047402]Schedule 1—Indexation provision amendments
[bookmark: _Toc194047403]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services –Transcatheter Aortic Valve Implantation) Determination 2018
1  Subsection 9(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167412][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047404]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox, Dysport or Xeomin Injection) Determination 2020
2  Subsection 7(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167413][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047405]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services - Optometric Services) Determination 2020
3  Subsection 16(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167414][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047406]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Extracorporeal Photopheresis) Determination 2020
4  Subsection 7(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167415][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047407]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Botox Injection) Determination 2020
5  Subsection 7(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167416][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047408]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services—Transcatheter Mitral Valve Repair) Determination 2021
6  Subsection 7(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167418][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047409]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Extracorporeal Photopheresis for Chronic Graft Versus Host Disease) Determination 2022
7  Subsection 9(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167419][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047410]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Cleft and Craniofacial Services) Determination 2024
8  Subsection 9(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047411]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Heart Health Assessment No.2) Determination 2019
[bookmark: _Toc193782651]9  Subsection 8(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[bookmark: _Toc164167425][bookmark: _Hlk161319506][image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047412]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Other Medical Practitioner) Determination 2018
10  Subsection 7(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047413]Health Insurance (Section 3C Midwife and Nurse Practitioner Services) Determination 2020
11  Subsection 6A(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047414]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Allied Health Services) Determination 2024
12  Subsection 11(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).
[bookmark: _Toc194047415]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services – Telehealth and Telephone Attendances) Determination 2021
13  Subsection 8(1)
Repeal the subsection, substitute:
(1) At the start of 1 July 2025 (the indexation time), each amount covered by subsection (2) is replaced by the amount worked out using the following formula:
[image: 1.024 multiplied by the amount immediately before the indexation time]
Note:             The indexed fees could in 2025 be viewed on the Department of Health and Aged Care’s MBS Online website (https://www.mbsonline.gov.au).

[bookmark: _Toc194047416]Schedule 2—Indexation amendments
[bookmark: _Toc164167422][bookmark: _Toc194047418]Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Whole Body Magnetic Resonance Imaging Scan) Determination 2022
1  Schedule (item 63564, column 3)
Omit “$1,616.40”, substitute “$1,655.20”.
[bookmark: _Toc164167423][bookmark: _Toc194047419]Health Insurance (Section 3C General Medical Services — Artificial Bowel Sphincter Services) Determination 2023
2  Schedule 1 (item 32221, column 3)
Omit “$1,029.75”, substitute “$1,054.45”.
[bookmark: _Toc194047420][bookmark: _Hlk194061673]Health Insurance (Section 3C Co‑Dependent Pathology Services) Determination 2018
3  Schedule 1 (item 72814, fee ($))
Omit “$74.50”, substitute “$76.30”.
[bookmark: _Toc194047421][bookmark: _Hlk194061832]Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging – Conjunctive Thallium-201 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2023
4  Schedule 1 (item 61470, column 3)
Omit “$1,515.05”, substitute “$1,551.40”.
[bookmark: _Toc194047422]Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Conjunctive Gallium-67 Nuclear Medicine Imaging Service) Determination 2022
5  Schedule 1 (item 61477, column 3)
Omit “$995.65”, substitute “$1,019.55”.
[bookmark: _Toc194047423][bookmark: _Hlk194062542]Health Insurance (Section 3C Diagnostic Imaging Services – Cardiac MRI for Myocarditis) Determination 2024
6  Schedule 1 (item 63390, column 3)
Omit “$602.15”, substitute “$616.60”.


	
	Error! Unknown document property name.
	3

	Document1 2/5/2025 10:36 AM




	6
	Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025
	

	




	
	Health Insurance Legislation Amendment (Indexation) Determination 2025
	7

	



image2.png
1.024 x the amount immediately before the indexation time




image1.jpg




