





[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Amendment (Maximum Accommodation Payment) Determination 2024 
I, Anika Wells, Minister for Aged Care, make the following determination.
Dated		4 November 2024	
Anika Wells
Minister for Aged Care






	



	



	



Contents
1  Name	1
2  Commencement	1
3  Authority	1
4  Schedules	1
Schedule 1—Amendments	2
Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Determination 2014	2







	ii
	Instrument Name Amendment (Subject Matter) Kind of Instrument Year
	

	




	
	Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Amendment (Maximum Accommodation Payment) Determination 2024
	i

	



[bookmark: _Toc136847082][bookmark: _Toc178150705]1  Name
		This instrument is the Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Amendment (Maximum Accommodation Payment) Determination 2024.
[bookmark: _Toc136847083][bookmark: _Toc178150706]2  Commencement
	(1)	Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

	Commencement information

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Provisions
	Commencement
	Date/Details

	1.  The whole of this instrument
	1 January 2025
	1 January 2025


Note:	This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.
	(2)	Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in any published version of this instrument.
[bookmark: _Toc136847084][bookmark: _Toc178150707]3  Authority
		This instrument is made under subsection 52G-3(1) of the Aged Care Act 1997.
[bookmark: _Toc178150708]4  Schedules
		Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc178150709]Schedule 1—Amendments
[bookmark: _Toc136847087][bookmark: _Toc178150710]Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Determination 2014
1  Section 110
Omit “$550 000.00”, substitute “$750,000.00”.
2. Subsection 111(1) 
Omit “$550 000.00”, substitute “$750,000.00”.



	
	Error! Unknown document property name.
	3

	Document2 11/11/2024 9:36 AM




	6
	Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Amendment (Maximum Accommodation Payment) Determination 2024
	

	




	
	Aged Care (Subsidy, Fees and Payments) Amendment (Maximum Accommodation Payment) Determination 2024
	7

	



image1.jpg




