
 

 

OPC65710 - A 

 
 

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment 

Determination (No. 7) 2021 

We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination. 

Dated 17 December 2021 

 

Signed Signed Signed 

John Conde AO Heather Zampatti Stephen Conry AM 

President Member Member 

 

 

 
   
   

Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



 

 

 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2021 i 

OPC65710 - A 

Contents 
1 Name ........................................................................................................................... 1 
2 Commencement .......................................................................................................... 1 
3 Authority ..................................................................................................................... 1 
4 Schedules .................................................................................................................... 1 

Schedule 1—Amendments 2 

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time 

Public Office) Determination 2021 2 

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time 

Public Office) Determination 2021 2 
 

Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



   

   

 

 

 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2021 1 

OPC65710 - A 

1  Name 

  This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 

2021. 

2  Commencement 

 (1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, 

or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any 

other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms. 

 

Commencement information 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 

Provisions Commencement Date/Details 

1.  The whole of this 

instrument 

The day after this instrument is registered. 21 December 2021 

Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will 

not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument. 

 (2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. 

Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in 

any published version of this instrument. 

3  Authority 

  This instrument is made under subsections 7(3) and (4) of the Remuneration 

Tribunal Act 1973. 

4  Schedules 

  Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or 

repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any 

other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms. 

Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



Schedule 1  Amendments 

   

 

 

2 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2021  

OPC65710 - A 

Schedule 1—Amendments 
   

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of 

Full-time Public Office) Determination 2021 

1  Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Chief Executive Officer, 
Australian Radioactive Waste Agency, column 3) 

Insert “Table 2B, item 18”. 

2  Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Chief Executive 
Officer, National Sports Tribunal) 

Insert: 

 

Head, National Suicide Prevention Office $304,830  2 

3  Section 11 (Table 2B, at the end of the table) 

Add: 

 

18 Chief Executive Officer, 

Australian Radioactive Waste 

Agency 

Total remuneration for Mr Sam Usher is $495,000 per year, 

for the initial term of his appointment (beginning on 

10 January 2022). 

4  Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, after table item 3BA) 

Insert: 

 

3BB Ms Lorraine Finlay Human Rights Commissioner (beginning on 

22 November 2021, until 21 November 2026) 

$40,000 

5  Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, after table item 7A) 

Insert: 

 

7B Ms Lorraine Finlay Human Rights Commissioner (beginning on 

22 November 2021, until 21 November 2026) 

$18,000 

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of 

Part-time Public Office) Determination 2021 

6  Section 16 (Table 3A, table item dealing with Commonwealth Scientific 
and Industrial Research Organisation) 

Repeal the item, substitute: 

 

Commonwealth Scientific 

and Industrial Research 

Organisation 

$150,000 $75,000 $75,000 Table 3B, 

items 2 and 

21 

1 

Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021



Amendments  Schedule 1 

   

 

 

 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 7) 2021 3 

OPC65710 - A 

7  Section 22 (Table 4A, item dealing with Defence Force Advocate, 
column 5) 

Omit “item 15”, substitute “items 15 and 15A”. 

8  Section 23 (Table 4B, after table item 15) 

Insert: 

 

15A Defence Force Advocate Section 21 does not apply. Daily fees (including daily fees 

affected by item 15 of this table) are to be calculated pro rata 

on the basis of a 6-hour working day. 

9  Section 46 (Table 7B, table item dealing with Northern Land Council—
Member, If engaged on general Council business, column 3) 

Omit “$312”, substitute “$334”. 

10  Section 46 (Table 7B, table item dealing with Central Land Council—
Member, If engaged on general Council business, column 3) 

Omit “$312”, substitute “$334”. 

Authorised Version F2021L01851 registered 20/12/2021


	Contents
	1  Name
	2  Commencement
	3  Authority
	4  Schedules
	Schedule 1—Amendments
	Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time Public Office) Determination 2021
	Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time Public Office) Determination 2021



	Bookmarks

