e
W) )
AUSTRALIA

AN

PB 51 of 2019

Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical
benefits supplied by approved
pharmacists) Amendment Determination
2019

We, the members of the Pharmaceutical Benefits Remuneration Tribunal, make this
Determination.

Dated 13 June 2019

ABBEYGAIL BEAUMONT
Chairperson

SHAUN LARKIN
Member

JEREMY SAMMUT
Member

WENDY PHILLIPS
Member

Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



Contents

I U NBINC. .ottt ettt e e et e e et e e e etbe e e e tae e e etta e e eetteeeetaeeeatteeeaateeeataeeannareeas 1
2 COMMENCEIMENL .....veiiiiiiieeeitieeecttee e ettt e eeteeeeetteeeeetteeeebeeeaesseeeasseeesaseeeassseeasseeeenseessasseaeasseeas 1
3 AULNOTIEY .ttt ettt ettt et sttt h e st e she et e b e e st e st et e et e entesneensenreentens 1
G SCREAUIES ...ttt e e e et e e eta e e eeateaeaaaaeas 1
Schedule 1—Amendments 2

Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical benefits supplied by approved pharmacists) Determination 2015

Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



1 Name

(1) This instrument is the Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical benefits supplied
by approved pharmacists) Amendment Determination 2019.

(2) This instrument may also be cited as PB 51 of 2019.

2 Commencement

This instrument commences 1 July 2019.

3 Authority

This instrument is made under paragraph 98B(1)(a) of the National Health Act
1953.

4 Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical benefits supplied by approved pharmacists)
Amendment Determination 2019 (PB 51 of 2019)

Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



Schedule 1—Amendments

Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical benefits supplied by approved
pharmacists) Determination 2015

[1] Section 6 (definition of dangerous drug fee)
Omit “$3.07”, substitute “$3.11”.

[2] Section 6 (definition of extemporaneously-prepared dispensing
fee)

Omit “$9.33”, substitute “$9.43”.

[3] Section 6 (definition of ready-prepared dispensing fee)
Omit “$7.29”, substitute “$7.39”.

[4] Paragraph 13(1)(a) (table)

Repeal the table, substitute:

AHI Tier Price to pharmacists for Administration, handling and

maximum quantity infrastructure fee for maximum quantity
1 <$180 $4.09, per dispense
2 > $180, < $2 089.71 $4.09, plus 3.5% of the amount by which

the price to pharmacists for maximum
quantity exceeds $180

3 > $2 089.71 $74.79

[5] Section 21 (table)

Repeal the table, substitute:

AHI Tier Price to pharmacists for Administration, handling and

maximum quantity infrastructure fee for maximum quantity
1 <$180 $4.09, per dispense
2 >$180,<$2089.71 $4.09, plus 3.5% of the amount by which

the price to pharmacists for maximum
quantity exceeds $180

3 >$2089.71 $74.79

Commonwealth price (Pharmaceutical benefits supplied by approved pharmacists)
Amendment Determination 2019 (PB 51 of 2019)

Authorised Version F2019L00843 registered 19/06/2019



	Contents
	1  Name
	2  Commencement
	3  Authority
	4  Schedules
	Schedule 1—Amendments


	Bookmarks

