

Schedule 1
[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

Radiocommunications (Digital Radio Multiplex Transmitter Licences – Application Fee) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1) 

The Australian Communications and Media Authority makes the following determination under paragraphs 102C(2)(b) and 102D(2)(b) of the Radiocommunications Act 1992.  
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_1]Dated: 27 March 2017

Richard Bean
[signed]
[bookmark: Minister]Member

James Cameron
[signed]
[bookmark: _GoBack]Member/General Manager

Australian Communications and Media Authority




	



2
Radiocommunications (Digital Radio Multiplex Transmitter Licences – Application Fee) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1)
[bookmark: _Toc444596031]
1  Name
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_3]		This is the Radiocommunications (Digital Radio Multiplex Transmitter Licences – Application Fee) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1).
[bookmark: _Toc444596032]2  Commencement
		This instrument commences at the start of the day after it is registered on the Federal Register of Legislation. 
Note:	The Federal Register of Legislation may be accessed at www.legislation.gov.au.
[bookmark: _Toc444596033]3  Authority
		This instrument is made under paragraphs 102C(2)(b) and 102D(2)(b) of the Radiocommunications Act 1992.
[bookmark: _Toc444596034]4  Amendments
		The instrument that is specified in Schedule 1 is amended as set out in the applicable items in that Schedule. 
 


Section 1


Schedule 1—Amendments
[bookmark: _Toc438623396][bookmark: _Toc444596036]Radiocommunications (Digital Radio Multiplex Transmitter Licences – Application Fee) Determination 2012 (F2012L01228)
1  Section 5
Omit “$460”, substitute “$472”. 
2  Section 6 
Omit “$460”, substitute “$472”. 


image1.jpg




