Schedule 1  Amendments of the Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Regulations 1993
  

  
  

[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

[bookmark: ConfidenceBlock]
Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1)

Select Legislative Instrument No. 63, 2013
I, Professor Marie Bashir AC CVO, Administrator of the Government of the Commonwealth of Australia, acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, make the following regulation under the Tradespersons’ Rights Regulation Act 1946.
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_2]Dated 		24 April 2013
Marie Bashir
Administrator
By Her Excellency’s Command
Dr Craig Emerson
Minister for Tertiary Education, Skills, Science and Research

  
  




OPC50284 - I
OPC50284 - I
	


OPC50284 - I
Contents
1	Name of regulation	1
2	Commencement	1
3	Authority	1
4	Schedule(s)	1
Schedule 1—Amendments of the Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Regulations 1993	1






	ii
	Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No.  )
	No. 63, 2013

	


OPC50284 - I

	No. 63, 2013
	Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1)
	i

	


OPC50284 - I
[bookmark: _Toc352247712]1  Name of regulation
[bookmark: _GoBack]		This regulation is the Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1).
[bookmark: _Toc352247713]2  Commencement
		This regulation commences on the day after it is registered.
[bookmark: _Toc352247714][bookmark: CB_S3P5L10C1]3  Authority
		This regulation is made under the Tradespersons’ Rights Regulation Act 1946.
[bookmark: _Toc352247715][bookmark: CB_S3P5L12C1]4  Schedule(s)
		Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc352247716][bookmark: opcAmSched][bookmark: opcCurrentFind]Schedule 1—Amendments of the Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Regulations 1993
  
1  Subregulation 3(1)
Omit “subregulations (3) and (4)”, substitute “subregulation (4)”.
2  Subregulation 3(1)
Omit “$300”, substitute “$930”.
3  Subregulation 3(2)
Omit “$270”, substitute “$1,000”.
4  Subregulation 3(3)
[bookmark: CB_S4P6L11C1]Repeal the subregulation.
5  Subregulation 3(4)
Omit “$130”, substitute “$170”.
6  Subregulation 4(2)
Omit “$300”, substitute “$930”.
7  Paragraph 4(3)(a)
Omit “$300”, substitute “$930”.


	2
	Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1)
	No. 63, 2013

	


OPC50284 - I

	No. 63, 2013
	Tradespersons’ Rights (Cost Recovery) Amendment Regulation 2013 (No. 1)
	1

	


OPC50284 - I
image1.wmf

