
Statutory Rules 
1980 No. 

373 

REGULATIONS UND E R THE SPIRITS A C T 11906* 

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, 
acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, hereby make 
the following Regulations under the Spirits Act 1906. 

Dated this Twenty Second 

day of December 1980. 

Z E L M A N COWEN 
Governor-General 

By His Excellency's Command, 

(Sgd) John Moore 
Minister of State for Business and Consumer Affairs 

AMENDMENTS OF THE SPIRITS R E G U L A T I O N S ! 

1. Regulation 30 of the Spirits Regulations is amended by omitting 
" $8.01 " and substitutine " $8.68 ". 

Para­
graph 26 (b) 
of die Act 

2... Regulation 42 of the Spirits Regulations is amended by omitting 
" $8.01 " and substituting " $8.68 ". 

Section 20 
and para­
graph 26 (e) 
of the Act 

* Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 1980. 
f Statutory Rules 1926 N o . 202 as amended to date. For previous amendments ice footnote t to Statutory Rules 

1980 N o . 112 and see also Statutory Rules 1980 N o . 112. 

31 December 

Printed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer 

S.R. No. 1187/80—Cat. No. —Recommended retail price 20c ' 12/30.10.1980 

Authorised Version F1997B02132 registered 26/02/2022


	Bookmarks

