
TRIPLICATE CO PY

-1\. A U ST R A L IA  ,/Jr"

(Statutory Rul
Administering 
documents s< 
reiariat in co

F.R.L.I.
>y In 
Sec- 
ition.1997B01837

Ex. Co. Secretariat: please complete this copy by 
Insertion of signatures and date of making, and send 
to: Instruments & Services Section,

Commercial & Drafting Division, Attorney-General's 
Department.

Statutory Rules 1985 No . ^  1 35'?/

Torres Strait Fisheries Regulations2 
(Amendment)

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, acting 
with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, hereby make the following 
Regulations under the Torres Strait Fisheries Act 1984.

Dated 1985.

N. M. STEPHEN
Governor-General

By His Excellency’s Command,

Minister of State for Primary Industry

Distinguishing number
1. Regulation 7 of the Torres Strait Fisheries Regulations is amended by 

omitting from sub-paragraph (3) (a) (ii) all the words after “surface vessels” 
and substituting “in black letters and figures on a yellow ground, each letter 
and figure being in accordance with the requirements of Schedule 3”.

Penalties
2. The Torres Strait Fisheries Regulations are amended as set out in 

Schedule 1.

Addition of Schedule
3. The Torres Strait Fisheries Regulations are amended by adding at the 

end the Schedule set out in Schedule 2 to these Regulations.

(S.R. 236/85) Cal. No. 12/ 8.1 1.1985

Authorised Version F1997B01837 registered 28/12/2022



2 Torres Strait Fisheries 1985 No. j f  3 ^ ^

SCHEDULE 1 Regulation 2

AMENDMENTS RELATING TO PENALTIES 
Sub-regulation 7 (3)—

Omit “exceeding $500”, substitute the following:
“exceeding—

(d) in the case of a natural person $2,000; or 
(c) in the case of a body corporate $10,000”.

Sub-regulation 8 (2)—
Omit “$500", substitute “$2,000”.

Sub-regulation 12 (4)—
Omit “$500", substitute “$2,000".

SCHEDULE 2 Regulation 3

SCHEDULE TO BE ADDED AT END OF TORRES STRAIT FISHERIES REGULATIONS:

“SCHEDULE 3 Regulation 7

REQUIREMENTS RELATING TO LETTERS AND FIGURES OF DISTINGUISHING 
, NUMBERS DISPLAYED ON BOATS

Column 1 

Length of Boat

Column 2

Required height 
of each letter 

or figure

Column 3
Required width 

of strokes 
making up 
each letter 

or figure

millimetres millimetres
Under 6 m e t r e s ......................................................... . . . 100 10 15
Under 10 metres but not under 6 metres . . . . . . . 200 20-25
Under 25 metres but not under 10 metres . . . . . . 300 35- 40
Not under 25 m e t r e s ................................................ . . . 450 60 65".

NOTES

1. Notified in the Commonwealth o f Australia Gazette on 1985. 0 c c e r n b n ,

2. Statutory Rules 1985 No. 9.

Primed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer

Authorised Version F1997B01837 registered 28/12/2022


	Bookmarks

