/TRIPLICATE cOPY

/\dmlmater Q

ﬁ ;_,', :;:ﬁ;ﬁ'. )lI\\I\|\|\|\|\ll$|\\||\\ll\!Il\|I|\\I|\\\\\llt|\\||\l\\\\l(
%AUSTRALM )
Statutory Rules 1993 No. /! JL© /

Therapeutic Goods (Charges) Regulations?
(Amendment)

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia,
acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, make the

following Regulations under the Therapeutic Goods (Charges) Act
1989.

Dated / 1993, 22 dung

Biro HaN N

Governor-General
By His Excellency’s Command,

Rosemary  (ROWLEN
Minister for Family Services

1. Commencement
1.1 These Regulations commence on 1 July 1993.

2. Amendment
2.1 The Therapeutic Goods (Charges) Regulations are amended as
set out in these Regulations.

92R431, 11/6/93,2:10 PM

Authorised Version F1996B00753 registered 26/02/2022



2 Therapeutic Goods (Charges) 1993 No. A 140

3. Regulation 3 (Charges)
3.1 Subparagraph 3 (1) (a) (i):
Omit “$350;”, substitute “$400;”.

3.2 Subparagraph 3 (1) (a) (ii):
Omit “$175;”, substitute “$210;”.

3.3 Paragraph 3 (1) (b):
Omit “$60.”, substitute “$90.”.

3.4 Paragraph 3 (2) (a):
Omit “$3,000;”, substitute “$3,400;”.

3.5 Paragraph 3 (2) (b):
Omit “$1,500;”, substitute “$1,700;".

3.6 Paragraph 3 (2) (¢):
Omit “$1,000.”, substitute “$1,200.”.

4. Regulation 4 (Charges not payable when turnover is
of low volume and low value)

4.1 Paragraphs 4 (2) (a) and (b):
Omit “2%”, substitute “5%”.

NOTES
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on /\ 1993, 2 S JW\/\Q
2. Statutory Rules 1990 Nog. 89-armd 3954 1991 No. 85; 1992 No. 83. "7/ as ameﬂclecl L7/

92R431, 11/6/93,2:10 PM

Authorised Version F1996B00753 registered 26/02/2022



	Bookmarks

