
  
  

Amendments  Schedule 1
  









Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022

No. 29, 2022





An Act to amend the Australian Research Council Act 2001, and for related purposes
  
  





 
Note: An electronic version of this Act is available on the Federal Register of Legislation (https://www.legislation.gov.au/)



Contents
1	Short title	1
2	Commencement	2
3	Schedules	2
Schedule 1—Amendments	3
Australian Research Council Act 2001	3







	ii
	Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
	No. 29, 2022




	No. 29, 2022
	Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
	i







Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
No. 29, 2022



An Act to amend the Australian Research Council Act 2001, and for related purposes
[Assented to 1 April 2022]
The Parliament of Australia enacts:
[bookmark: _Toc100057687]1  Short title
[bookmark: _GoBack]		This Act is the Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022.
[bookmark: _Toc100057688]2  Commencement
	(1)	Each provision of this Act specified in column 1 of the table commences, or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

	Commencement information

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Provisions
	Commencement
	Date/Details

	1.  The whole of this Act
	The day after this Act receives the Royal Assent.
	2 April 2022


Note:	This table relates only to the provisions of this Act as originally enacted. It will not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this Act.
	(2)	Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this Act. Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in any published version of this Act.
[bookmark: _Toc100057689]3  Schedules
		Legislation that is specified in a Schedule to this Act is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this Act has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc100057690][bookmark: opcAmSched][bookmark: opcCurrentFind]Schedule 1—Amendments
  
[bookmark: _Toc100057691]Australian Research Council Act 2001
1  At the end of subsection 48(2)
Add:
	; (u)	the financial year starting on 1 July 2024.
2  Paragraph 49(v)
Omit “$804,411,000”, substitute “$815,271,000”.
3  Paragraph 49(w)
Omit “$804,442,000”, substitute “$815,288,000”.
4  Paragraph 49(x)
Omit “$801,410,000”, substitute “$812,207,000”.
5  At the end of section 49
Add:
	; (y)	for the financial year starting on 1 July 2024—$811,169,000.




[Minister’s second reading speech made in—
House of Representatives on 2 December 2021
Senate on 30 March 2022]

(170/21)


	No. 29, 2022
	Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
	1




	2
	Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
	No. 29, 2022




	No. 29, 2022
	Australian Research Council Amendment Act 2022
	3



oleObject2.bin
[image: image1.png]






image1.wmf

oleObject1.bin
[image: image1.png]






