
Higher Education Funding Amendment Act 
1991 

No. 53 of 1991 

An Act to increase the amount that may be spent on 
higher education 

[Assented to 24 April 1991] 

The Parliament of Australia enacts: 

Short title etc. 
1.(1) This Act may be cited as the Higher Education Funding 

Amendment Act 1991. 

(2) In this Act, "Principal Act" means the Higher Education Funding 
Act 1988K 

Commencement 
2. This Act commences on the day on which it receives the Royal 

Assent. 

Maximum amounts 
3. The Principal Act is amended as set out in the Schedule. 

Authorised Version C2004A04128



SCHEDULE Section 3 

AMENDMENTS OF MAXIMUM AMOUNTS 

Paragraph 17 (c): 
Omit "$2,520,739,000", substitute "52,567,853.000". 

Paragraph 17 (d): 
Omit "$2,571,228,000", substitute "$2,619,349,000". 

Paragraph 17 (e): 
Omit "$2,657,966,000", substitute "$2,706,961,000". 

Paragraph 19 (4) (d): 
Omit "$23,662,000", substitute "$24,107,000". 

Paragraph 20 (3) (c): 
Omit "$59,050,000", substitute "$59,782,000". 

Paragraph 20 (3) (d): 
Omit "$67,092,000", substitute "$67,923,000". 

Paragraph 20 (3) (e): 
Omit "$67,092,000", substitute "$67,923,000". 

Paragraph 21 (3) (c): 
Omit "$29,948,000", substitute "$30,258,000". 

Paragraph 21 (3) (d): 
Omit "$30,877,000", substitute "$31,260,000". 

Paragraph 21 (3) (e): 
Omit "$31,753,000", substitute "$32,146,000". 

Paragraph 22 (5) (d): 
Omit "$1,555,000", substitute "$1,600,000". 

Paragraph 22 (5) (e): 
Omit "$3,667,000", substitute "$3,712,000". 

Paragraph 23 (4) (c): 
Omit "$215,266,000", substitute "$216,648,000". 

Paragraph 23 (4) (d): 
Omit "$224,710,000", substitute "$229,012,000". 

Paragraph 23 (4) (e): 
Omit "$227,195,000", substitute "$231,326,000". 

Paragraph 24 (3) (c): 
Omit "$4,105,000", substitute "$4,156,000". 
Paragraph 24 (3) (d): 
Omit "$4,105,000", substitute "$4,156,000". 

Higher Education Funding Amendment No. 53, 1991 

Authorised Version C2004A04128



SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 24 (3) (e): 
Omit "$4,105,000", substitute "$4,156,000". 

Paragraph 26 (5) (c): 
Omit "$102,261,000", substitute "$106,514,000". 

Paragraph 26 (S) (d): 
Omit "$102,261,000", substitute "$106,514,000". 

Paragraph 26 (5) (e): 
Omit "$212,453,000", substitute "$216,706,000". 

NOTE 
1. No. 2, 1989, as amended. For previous amendments, see No. 138, 1988; 

Nos. 80, 168 and 179, 1989; and No. 122, 1990. 

[Minister's second reading speech made in— 
House of Representatives on 7 March 1991 
Senate on 10 April 1991] 

Higher Education Funding Amendment No. 53, 1991 

Authorised Version C2004A04128


	Bookmarks

