
DRIED VINE FRUITS LEVY AMENDMENT
ACT 1976

No. 11 of 1976

An Act to amend the Dried Vine Fruits Levy Act 1971.

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen, and the Senate and House of 
Representatives o f the Commonwealth o f Australia, as follows:—

1 .  (1) This Act may be cited as the Dried Vine Fruits Levy Amend- Short title
ment Act 1976 .* 1 and citation.

(2) The Dried Vine Fruits Levy Act 1971,2 as amended by this Act, 
may be cited as the Dried Vine Fruits Levy Act 1971-1976.

2. This Act shall come into operation on the day on which it receives Commence-
the Royal Assent.1 ment

3. The Dried Vine Fruits Levy Act 1971 is amended as set out in the Amend-
Schedule. ments·

SCHEDULE Section 3
AMENDMENTS

Provision amended Amendment

Paragraph 5 (1) (a) . . (a) Omit “ton”, substitute “tonne”.
(b) Omit “Ten dollars the amount per ton”, substitute “$10 the 

amount per tonne”.
Paragraph 5 (1) (b) . . Omit “ tons’’.substitute “tonnes”.
Sub-section 5 (2) . . . Omit “ tons” (wherever occurring), substitute “tonnes”.
Sub-section 6(1) . . . (a) Omit “ ton ” (wherever occurring), substitute “ tonne ’ ’.

(b) Omit “Ten dollars”, substitute “$ 10”.
Sub-section 6(2) . . . Omit “Twenty dollars per ton”, substitute “$20 per tonne”.

NOTES

1. Act No. 11,1976; assented to 1 April 1976.

2. Act No. 131,1971.

Authorised Version C2004A01442


	Bookmarks

